CITY OF GROVES

Notice of Regular Meeting of the City Council|

City Council Chamber Groves City Hall
December 18, 2023 Directly following the
Public Hearing at 5:00 p.m.

AGENDA
. Call meeting to order - prayer.
Il. Roll Call.
lll. Welcome and recognize guests and news media.
IV. Approve the minutes of December 4, 2023 City Council Meeting.
V. Reports/Citizen Comments:
VI. Mayor:
a. Consider rescheduling the January 15, 2023 City Council Meeting due to the observance of
b. gigéuz?;nd consider amending the building permit fee ordinance.

VIl. City Attorney:

VIll. City Manager:
a. Invoices

IX. Councilmember Comments:

X. Adjourn.

City of Groves Page 1



City of Groves

Agenda Item Information Form

Council Meeting Date:  12/18/2023 Department: _City Manager Agenda Item No. ‘

Title for Item (same as to be placed on Agenda): Consider rescheduling the January 15, 2023 City Council
Meeting due to the observance of MLK Day.

Party(ies) requesting placement of this item on the agenda: _City Manager Kevin Carruth

Submitted to City Manager’s Office on: Date: 12/12/23  Time: 1:05 p.m. By:  c tHiBobEAUX

Explanation of Item: January 15" is a City Holiday and since we already canceled the meeting for January 1% it is
staff’s recommendation that we move this meeting to Monday, January 8. By doing this it will still give us two

meetings for the month of January and eliminate having such a big gap between meetings.

Deadline for Approval: Immediately.

Staff Recommendation: Staff recommends moving the January 15" meeting to January 8™.

Alternative (if any) for consideration: Any day Council agrees on.

identify any attachments to this document:

Specific Council Action Requested: None (Information item only) ~ Motion X
Ordinance — Number Resolution — Number Other — Specify: )
Signed: Date: Approved: Date: [% {é ; Zé:f
Department Head City Manager
FUNDING (IF APPLICABLE)
Are sufficient funds specifically designated and currently available for this purpose? YES NO []
If yes, specify account no. If no, explain and identify intended funding source:
PAYMENT REQUEST
Amount of requested payment $ Cumulative total of payments to date for this project/item
(if applicable): $ Balance due for this project/purchase (if applicable): $

ACTION TAKEN BY COUNCIL

APPROVED: [ ] NOT APPROVED: [ ] Any follow-up action required? YES [] NO []
If yes, explain

City of Groves Page 2




City of Groves
Agenda Item Information Form

Inspections and a
Council Meeting Date: 12/18/23 Department: Permits Agenda Item No.

Title for Item (same as to be placed on Agenda): Discuss and consider amending building permit fee
ordinance

Party(ies) requesting placement of this item on the agenda: Don Pedraza, Building Official

Submitted to City Manager’s Office on: Date: 12/13/23  Time: 12:00 p.m. By: L. Ozley
Explanation of Item: Amends the building permit fees. Please see attached memo
Deadline for Approval:

Staff Recommendation:  Approval of ordinance

Alternative (if any) for consideration:

Identify any attachments to this document:

Specific Council Action Requested: None (Information item only) / Motion X
Ordinance — Number Resolution — Number Other — Spécify:
- , , ////" /:77 " /' /l/ /: />3
Signed: _/ L 7 / Date: |7 [/ /7 Approved: Date: /243
Department Head City Manager

FUNDING (IF APPLICABLE)

Are sufficient funds specifically designated and currently available for this purpose? YES [] NO []

If yes, specify account no. If no, explain and identify intended funding source:
PAYMENT REQUEST

Amount of requested payment § N/A Cumulative total of payments to date for this project/item

(if applicable): $ Balance due for this project/purchase (if applicable): $

ACTION TAKEN BY COUNCIL

APPROVED: [ ] NOT APPROVED: [ ] Any follow-up action required? YES [] NO []
If yes, explain

City of Groves Page 3




MEMORANDUM

Date: December 13, 203
To: Mayor and City Council
From: Kevin Carruth, City Manager

Don Pedraza, Building Official
Lamar Ozley, Finance Director

Re: Updating Permit and Inspection Fees

Effective January 1, 2024, H.B. 1922 requires the City Council to hold a public hearing and vote
to reauthorize any city fee charged as a condition of constructing, renovating, or remodeling a
residential or commercial structure at least once every ten years. Under the bill, if a city fails to
do so by the tenth anniversary of the fee being adopted or reauthorized, the fee will be
automatically abolished by law. In addition, H.B. 852, effective May 21, 2019, provides that: (1)
in determining the amount of a building permit or inspection fee required in connection with the
construction or improvement of a residential dwelling, a city may not consider: (a) the value of the
dwelling; or (b) the cost of constructing or improving the dwelling; and (2) a city may not require
the disclosure of information related to the value of or cost of constructing or improving a
residential dwelling as a condition of obtaining a building permit except as required by the Federal
Emergency Management Agency for participation in the National Flood Insurance Program.

As presented at the December 4, 2023, city council meeting, an analysis of inspection fees
revealed that the City’s fees have not been updated since 2011 while the expense of providing the
service has grown each year. Including the direct and indirect costs of the service, the current fee
structure is approximately half the actual expense of providing the service, leading to all taxpayers
subsidizing this user-based service.

Staff proposes a two-phase approach to bring the fee structure to the point where the service is
self-sustaining and no longer subsidized by taxpayers. This proposed fee structure allows for the
implementation of new software that will improve the efficiency and effectiveness of the
department, and also improve customer service for users of the service. Phase 1 would increase
fees by 75 percent effective January 1, 2024, and Phase 2 would increase fees an additional 25
percent effective October 1, 2024 and initiate an escalator based on CPI for these fees to ensure
future costs will be covered.

City of Groves Page 4



10

11
12
13

14

15

16

17

18

19

HEADER

HEADER

SECTION 1: - That Chapter 28, BUILDINGS, ARTICLE 11 - INTERNATIONAL

»

BUILDING CODE, Sec. 28-14 Amendments, Sec 108.2 Schedule of building permit fees of

the Code of Ordinances, City of Groves, Texas, is hereby amended to increase the permit fees.

Said Sec. 28-14 Amendments, Sec 108.2 Schedule of building permit fees of the Code of

Ordinances of the City of Groves. lexas is hereby amended to read as follows:

" Sec. 28-14 Amendments, Sec 108.2 Schedule of building permit fees.

A

Chapter 28 — BUILDINGS
ARTICLE II. - INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

Sec. 28-14. - Amendments.

Sec. 108. Fees.

Sec. 108.2. Schedule of permit fees is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 108.2. Schedule of building permit fees

Building permit fees shall be based on valuation in accordance with the national average.
New construction or additions valuation examples are:

OfﬁceBulldmgs - E$144:00 pér sqﬁax;e fodt

Cényenieééé Store $9600 per sﬁug{e foot

Resfaurants/F ast Food §$169.00 per square foot
Day Care :}$124.00 per square foot

City of Groves

[ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

[ Formatted: Centered

[ Formatted: Numbering: Continuous

[ Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt ]

[ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

Page 5



20

21
22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

35

Remodel valuations shall be based on the actual contract cost, inclusive of electrical, plumbing,
mechanical and alarms.

1.
Permit fees.

Total Valuation 'Fee

'No fee, unless inspection required, in which case a $25.00 fee for each

$1,000.00 and less inspection shall be charged.

$1,001.00t0  $25.0043.75 for the first $1,000.00 plus $7.0012.25 for each additional
$50,000.00 thousand or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000.00.

$50,001.00 to $350.00612.50 for the first $50,000.00 plus $6-6610.50 for each additional
$100,000.00 |thousand or fraction thereof, to and including $100,000.00.

$100,001.00 to $650.001.137.50 for the first $100,000.00 plus $5-068.75 for each
$500,000.00 additional thousand or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000.00.

2.500.004.375.00 for the first $500,000.00 plus $47.00 for each

$500,001.00 and up additional thousand, or fraction thereof.

2.

Issuance of Certificate of Occupancy.

For the issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy the fee shall be one hundred ($160175) dollars.
3.

Moving fee.

(a)

For the moving of any building or structure the fee shall be $156-60262.50.

4.

Demolition fee.

(a)

City of Groves

Page 6



36

37

38

39

40

41

42

43

44

45

46

47

48

49

50

51

52

53

54

55

56

57

58

59

60

61

For the demolition of any residence or commercial building or structure, the fee shall be
$100175.00, plus a deposit of $+00175.00 shall be required, which deposit will be returned if the
job is completed and lot cleared of all debris within ninety (90) days.

(b)

For the demolition of any accessory building or structure, the fee shall be $25:6043.75.

5.

For mechanical permit fees.

Shall be the same as Sec. 108.2

6.

For electrical permit fees.

Shall be the same as Chapter29 Chapter 29 of the Code of Ordinances.

7

For plumbing and gas permit fees.

Shall be the same as Chapter 34, Chapter 31 of the Code of Ordinances.

8.

Plan-checking fees.

When the valuation of the proposed construction exceeds $100,000.00 and a plan is required to
be submitted, a plan checking fee shall be paid to the Building Official at the time of submitting
plans and specifications for checking. Said plan-checking fee shall be equal to ten percent (10%)

of the building permit fee as set forth in 108.2, but in no event to exceed a maximum fee of
$2,500:004.375.00. Such plan-checking fee is in addition to the building permit fee.

SECTION 2: - That Chapter 28, BUILDINGS, ARTICLE 11 - INTERNATIONAL

BUILDING CODE, Sec. 28-14 Amendments, Sec 108.4 Work commencing before permit

issuance of the Code of Ordinances. City of Groves, Texas. is_hereby amended to increase the

City of Groves

{ Formatted: No underline, Font color: Auto

[Formatted: No underline, Font color: Auto

[Formatted: No underline, Font color: Auto

LFormatted: No underline, Font color: Auto

[Formatted: Font: 12 pt

[Formatted: Font: Bold

[ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

Page 7



62

63

64

65

66

67

68
69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76

77

78

79

80

81

82

83

84

85

86

permit fees. Said Sec. 28-14 Amendments, Sec 108.4 Work commencing before permit

issuance of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Groves. Texas is hereby amended to read as .- [Formatted: Font: 12 pt

follows:

" Sec. 28-14 Amendments, Sec 108. 108.4 Work commencing before permit

issuance, e [Fonnaned: Font: 12 pt

—_—x

= [Formatted: Font: 12 pt

Sec. 108.4. Work commencing before permit issuance is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 108.4. Work commencing before permit issuance.

Where work for which a permit is required by this Code is begun prior to obtaining said permit,
the fees shall be doubled, plus an additional administrative fee of $160175.00 shall be assessed
when the value of the construction-werkpermit is tess-than-$1002,060.00 or less. If the value of
the eonstruetion-permit work-is $2;600100.00 or greater, the additional administrative fee
assessed shall be $500875.00. The payment of such double permit fee and the additional
administrative fee shall not relieve any person from fully complying with the requirements of
this Code in the execution of the work, nor from any other penalties prescribed herein.

- '[Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt J

SECTION 3: - That Chapter 28, BUILDINGS, ARTICLE III - GROVES RESIDENTIAL . "[Formatted: Font: 12 pt

CONSTRUCTION CODE, Sec. 28-23 Amendments to the international Residential Code,

(3) Sec R108.2 Schedule of building permit fees of the Code of Ordinances. City of Groves,

Texas. is hereby amended to increase the permit fees. Said Sec. 28-23 Amendments to the

international Residential Code, (3) Sec R108.2 Schedule of building permit fees of the Code

of Ordinances of the City of Groves. Texas is hereby amended to read as follows:

" Sec. 28-23 Amendments to the international Residential Code, (3) Sec R108.2

Schedule of building permit fees

City of Groves

Page 8



87 [Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt ]

A

88  ARTICLEIIL - GROVES RESIDENTIAL CONSTRUCTION CODE

89  Sec. 28-23. - Amendments to the International Residential Code.
90 (3
91  Sec. R108.2. Schedule of building permit fees is amended to read as follows:

92  On all buildings, structures or alterations requiring a building permit, as set forth in Section
93  105.1, the fee shall be paid as required at the time of {iling the application in accordance with the

94  following schedule:

95 RESIDENTIAL CONSTRUCTION

1$568.75 issuance/inspection fee plus
180.53/square foot for total area under roof

New Construction Building Permit Fee:

New Construction Plan Review Fee: J$0.27/square foot for total area under roof

|$306.25 issuance/inspection fee plus

$0.27/square foot

Remodel/Renovations Permit Fee:

'briveways/fr’atios/ Sidewalks: 7 ‘ $87.50 7 ‘
Roofs: 1$175.00 |
Fences: i$70.0 ‘
Inground Pools: !$437.50 |
Carports, Patios, Portable Buildings or any “3,,70'00 |

Non-Permanent structure:

96

97  The Building Official reserves the right to determine whether an inspection should be required
98  for work not fully described above and in doing so. the permit fee shall include the permit
99 issuance and inspection fee of $70.00 plus $43.75 for each additional inspection as required.

100  Building-permitfeesshall-be-based-onvaluationinnecordanee-with-the-nationalaverage:
101 New-construeton-oradditionsvaluation-examples-are:

102 New-Construetion-or-Additions

Garage-Area $60-00-persquarefoet

City of Groves Page 9



103

104
105

106

107

108

109

110

111

112

113

114

115
116

117

118

[ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

Remodelvaluations-shall-be based-en-the-actual-contract-cost—inelusive-ofelecttical-plumbing
and-mechapieal (A/C):

Schedule-of permitfees:

@

Permit-fees:

-"Fe%al-véiuaﬁeﬁ Fees o 7

X diteas :Neiee—uﬁles&mspee&en;:requ&ed Mﬂekease—a—%—%ﬂfe&{ér—eaeh ‘

$1;000-00-an i hallbe-of |

$50,000:00 fraction il c | including $50.000.06

; 3 Y B | B [} % b N o B B B 1

$§9—994—9(}w MG&M@&MMMM

$+904)90 06 er—fraeﬂeﬂ-thefee#—teﬂﬂé—me}aémg%@()%g

$400.4}04 -00-to $§5@-@9—f6ﬁh€—ﬂfﬁt—$]—00-999—99—?4&5—%—904%6&6#&%&1&6&34—&%@&9&94

$560,000-60 |erfraction-thereof-to-and-ineluding-$500,000-60-
\Mmmwmmwm&@%mm
‘theusand—e{—&ae&@ﬂ—thefeef—

b.

Certificate of Occupancy.

For the issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy the fee shall be fifty dollars ($3087.650)
c.
Moving fee.

For the moving of any building or structure the fee shall be one hundred fifty dollars
($450262.5:000).

d.

Demolition fee.

City of Groves

Page 10



119
120
121
122
123

l124
125
126
127
128
129

I130
131
132

‘133
134
135
136
137
138
139
140
141
142
143
144

145

146

1.

For the demolition of any residence, the fee shall be one hundred dollars ($166175.00), plus a
deposit of one hundred dollars ($160175.00) shall be required, which deposit will be returned if
the job is completed and lot cleared of all debris within ninety (90) days.

2.

For the demolition of any accessory building, the fee shall be twenty dollars ($20-0043.75).

(3

Mechanical permit fees.

Shall be the same as #1. above.

f.

For electrical permit fees.

Shall be the same as-chapter29 chapter 29 of the Code of Ordinances.

g.

For plumbing and gas permit fees.

Shall be the same as-chapter 31 chapter 31 of the Code of Ordinances.

h.

Penalties.

Where work for which a permit is required by this Code is begun prior to obtaining said permit,
the fees shall be doubled, plus an additional administrative fee of one hundred seventy-five
dollars ($100175.00) shall be assessed when the value of the construction-permit werk-is less
than-two thousandone hundred dollars ($1002:000.00) or less. If the value of the censtruction
permit werk-is two-thousandone hundred dollars ($2;000100.00) or greater, the additional
administrative fee assessed shall be five-eight hundred seventy-five dollars ($506875.00). The
payment of such double permit fee and the additional administrative fee shall not relieve any

person from fully complying with the requirements of this Code in the execution of the work, nor
from any other penalties prescribed herein.

i.

Plan-checking fees.

City of Groves

{Formatted: No underline, Font color: Auto

[Formatted: No underline, Font color: Auto

[Formatted: No underline, Font color: Auto

[Formatted: No underline, Font color: Auto

Page 11



147
148
149
150
151
152

153
154

155
156
157

158
159

160
161

162

163

164
165

166

167

168

169

170

171

172

173

When the valuation of the proposed construction-permit exceceeds $106,000.00 and a plan is
required to be submitted, a plan checking fee shall be paid to the Building Official at the time of
submitting plans and specifications for checking. Said plan-checking fee shall be equal to ten
percent (10%) of the building permit fee as set forth in R108.2, but in no event to exceed a
maximum fee of $2:5064.375.00. Such plan-checking fee is in addition to the building permit

fee.

( Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

SECTION 4: - That Chapter 29, ELECTRICITY, ARTICLE V — PERMITS, Sec. 29-21 Fees, ... [ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

administrative, of the Code of Ordinances. City of Groves. Texas, is hereby amended to increase

the permit fees. Said Sec. 29-21 Fees, administrative of the Code of Ordinances of the City of

Groves, Texas is hereby amended to read as follows:

" Sec. 29-21 Fees, administrative

[ Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

A

Chapter 29 — ELECTRICITY
ARTICLE V. — PERMITS

Sec. 29-21. - Fees, administrative.

Payment of permit fees shall be made prior to the issuance of a permit, and shall be based on the
schedule of fees herein set out:

(€8]

Fee schedule.

Issuance of permit .....$2035.00
Service up to 200 amperes .....2035.00
Over 200 amperes .....4670.00

Each additional meter .....2035.00
Each additional panel .....2635.00

Each outlet, switch and receptacle .....0.50-88

City of Groves Page 12



174

175

176

177

178

179

180

181

182

183

184

185

186

187

188

189

190

191

192

193

194

195

196

(V%)

Fixtures .....+-502.6

Dishwasher .....5-008.75

Disposal .....5:008.75

Dryer .....46-6017.50

Washing machine .....16-:0817.50

Room air conditioner outlet .....5-008.75
Space heating (each), furnace .....18:0017.50
Each motor up to five (5) HP .....10:0017.50
Each motor over five (5) HP .....26:8635.00

Electrical signs .....40-:0070.00

Each transformer .....25-0043.75

Elevators, dumbwaiters, escalators .....25:0043.75
Gasoline pumps .....40:0017.50

Floodlight poles .....+6-:6617.50

Welding machine outlet .....+6:0017.50
Temporary service on pole ....25:0043.75

Re-inspection .....25-0043.75

Minimum on any electrical permit .....4070.00
Re-inspection for lights or name change .....25:0043.75

Swimming pool .....36:0052.50

City of Groves

Page 13



197
198
199
200
201
202
203
204
205
206
207
208
209
210
211
212
213
214
215
216
217
218
219

220
221

222

223

224

225

226

227

(2)
Administrative fee.
a.

Where work for which a permit is required by this Code doubled, plus an additional
administrative fee of one hundred seventy five dollars ($106175.00) shall be assessed when the
value of the construction-permit work-is less-than-two-theusandone hundred dollars ($12600.00)
or less. If the value of the ecenstruction-permit work-is twe-theusandone hundred dollars
($2666100.00) or greater, the additional administrative fee assessed shall be- eight hundred
seventy-five five-hundred dollars ($566875.00). The payment of such double permit fee and the
additional administrative fee shall not relieve any person from fully complying with the
requirements of this Code in the execution of the work, nor from any other penalties prescribed
herein.

b

Outlet—the-term—"outlet shatl-mean-and-be-construed-asany-peint-on-a-wiring-system-at-whieh-a
switch-is-installed-or-eleetrieity-is-tokenfroma-cirenit-for tight—power-orany-other purpose-ot

serviger

&

Qutlet-addition-outetextension—The-term-"outlet-additionor"outlet-extensionshall-mean-and
be- cmueéa&aﬂsﬁtltlekinstdllahen made-over aadﬂbeve%h&number—as-i equwted ﬂﬁhe

Heorsepowergrouping—Permit-applications-covering-the-installation-of-metors-on-any-job-shall

A

SECTION 5: - That Chapter 30, PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, ARTICLE I - IN

GENERAL, Sec. 30-3 Amendments to the International Property Maintenance Code of the §

Code of Ordinances, City of Groves. Texas. is hereby amended to increase the permit fees. Said

Sec. 30-3 Amendments_to_the International Propertv Maintenance Code of the Code of

Ordinances of the City of Groves. Texas is hereby amended to read as follows:

City of Groves

(Formatted: Font; (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

(Formatted: Font: 12 pt

J
J

Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Formatted: Font: 12 pt

'[Formaﬂed: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: 12 pt

|
)
)
)

Page 14



228

229

230

231
232
233
234
235
236
237
238
239
240
241
242
243
244
245
246
247
248
249

250

251

252

253

" Sec. 30-3 Amendments to the International Property Maintenance Code,

A

Chapter 30 - PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

Sec. 30-3. - Amendments to the International Property Maintenance Code.
Sec. 103.5 Fees. is hereby amended to read as follows.

The fees for the activities and services performed by the department in carrying out it's
responsibilities under this code shall be as prescribed in the Technical Ordinances, Part II of the
City of Groves Code of Ordinances.

Sec. 103.6 is hereby created to read as follows:
103.6 Work commencing prior to the issuance of permit.

Where work for which a permit is required by this Code is begun prior to obtaining said permit,
the fees shall be doubled, plus an additional administrative fee of $166175.00 shall be assessed
when the value of the eonstruction-permit work-is tess-than-$2.000100.00_or less. If the value of
the eonstruetion-permit work-is $2,000100.00 or greater, the additional administrative fee
assessed shall be $500875.00. The payment of such double permit fee and the additional
administrative fee shall not relieve any person from fully complying with the requirements of
this Code in the execution of the work, nor from any other penalties prescribed herein.

SECTION 6: - That Chapter 30, PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, ARTICLE 1I —

REGISTRATION AND INSPECTION OF ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS—

et LFormatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

)

'[Formatted: Font: 12 pt

;
{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

GENERAL PROVISIONS, Sec. 30-14 Fees of the Code of Ordinances, City of Groves, Texas, ..

is hereby amended to increase the permit fees. Said Sec. 30-14 Fees of the Code of Ordinances of

the City of Groves, Texas is hereby amended to read as follows:

" Sec. 30-14 Fees

City of Groves

)

1

[ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

J

Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

[ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

)

Page 15



254
255

256
257

|258
259

260
261
262

263
264

265
266
267
268
269
270

271

272
273

274

275
276
277

278

279
280
281
282

ARTICLE II. - REGISTRATION AND INSPECTION OF ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY
DWELLINGS—GENERAL PROVISIONS

Sec. 30-14. - Fees.

(2)

A first-year fee of ene-two hundred fifs-sixly two dollars and fifty cents ($456-66262.50) for

each one-family dwelling or dwelling unit of a two-family dwelling required to register shall be:

QY]
Submitted with the registration form required by this article; and
@)

Submitted with a new registration upon a change of ownership of the one-family dwelling or
dwelling unit of a two-family dwelling.

(b)

Unless an additional year has been added under subsection-30-13, 30-13(c), a second-year fee of

____ b

a two-family dwelling required to register shall be:

¢y

Submitted with the registration form required by this article; and
2

Submitted with a new registration upon a change of ownership of the one-family dwelling or
dwelling unit of a two-family dwelling.

(c)

A registration is valid for one year from the date the completed registration form is filed in the
office of the building official, and payment of the registration fee for that year has been made,
unless the ownership of the complex changes.

(d)

A registration is not assigned or transferable. If a change of ownership of the complex occurs
during the period that a registration is otherwise valid, the landlord of the complex shall have
thirty (30) days from the date the change of ownership occurred to file a new registration with
building official, and pay a new registration fee.

City of Groves

| Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 EEJ

L Formatted: No underline, Font color: Auto

be

| Formatted: No underline, Font color: Auto

Page 16

L



283 (e)

284  If a one-family dwelling or dwelling unit of a two-family dwelling fails a follow-up inspection,
285  the city shall assess the owner a follow-up inspection fee of fifty-cighty seven dollars and fifty
286  cents ($50-06087.50). Written notice of the assessed follow-up inspection fee shall be sent by the
287  building official via Certified U.S. mail to the owner.

288 ) e Gormatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt ]
289
290 SECTION 7: - That Chapter 30, PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, ARTICLE III — - [Formatted: Font: 12 pt ]

291 REGISTRATION AND INSPECTION OF MULTI-FAMILY DWELLINGS

292 COMPLEXES—GENERAL PROVISIONS, Sec. 30-33 Registration and inspections of the

293  Code of Ordinances, City of Groves, Texas, is hereby amended to increase the permit fees. Said

294  Sec. 30-33 Registration and inspections of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Groves, Texas

295  is hereby amended to read as follows:

296 " Sec. 30-33 Registration and inspections

297 e &ormaned: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt ]

A

298  ARTICLE III. - REGISTRATION AND INSPECTION OF MULTI-FAMILY DWELLING
299 COMPLEXES—GENERAL PROVISIONS

300  Sec. 30-33. - Registration and inspections

301 (a)

302  Certifieate-of-occupaney-

303 ()

304  No-multi-family-dwelling-complex-shall be-used-or-eceupied:-and-no-change-in-the-exdisting
305  oceupaney-classificationorownership-efamulti-family-dwelling complex—or-any-porton

306  thereofishallbe-madeuntiHthe landlord-has-obtained-a-certificate-ol-oceupaney-as-previded-by
307  the-buildingeode:

308 (2

City of Groves Page 17



309
310
311
312
313
314
315
316
317
318

319
320

321

322

323

324
325

326
327
328
329
330
331
332
333
334
335
336
337
338

339

Issuance-of a-certificate-of occupaney-shatbnot-be-construcd-as-an approval-of a-vielation-of-the
pwammwmmmwm

(=]

complex-in-vielation-of-this-seetion:

)
Resistradi -
&

Thelandlord-of a-multi-family-dwelling-complex-shall- annually-register-the-complex-with-the
buttding-eflicial:

&

M}dlefé«eﬁaﬂa&.l&mw-dwdﬁﬂggmﬁe&wh%&mﬁwe%aﬁem—eﬁmdmf
5 ¢ ind ”"] safier: '

&)

A-registration-is-valid-forone-yearfrom-the-date-the-completed-registration-form-is-filed-in-the

office-ofthe-buildingofficial-and payment-of theregistration-teehas-been-made—unlessthe

ownership-of-the-complex-changes-

“

}ﬂafhaageeﬁewaem#fret'—meeemple*eeemgduringth&peﬁed—tha&-a—reg&s&aﬁ%ethemise

1 l . i gl ¢ . . . ] l l .] 1. [‘ﬁ . l’ l

registration-fee:

&)

City of Groves

Page 18



340
341

342
343
344
345
346
347
348
349
350
351
352
353
354

355

356
357

358

359

360

361
362

363
364
365
366

367

Theregistration-shall-be-on-a-form-preseribed-by-the-building-officialandshatlata-minimum
contain-the following-information-about-the-complexs

&

The-names-addresses—and-telephenenumbers-ef the-ownerproperty-managerresident-manager;

wspeﬁét&emefgﬁwyem}dﬂms—aﬂé&wlepheﬂeﬁumbeﬁwhﬁeﬁméemp}ewe&embe
eeﬂ%ac{eekdunﬂgaﬁy—z%e&ppeﬁed—EmergeﬁeyeenéiwhaHﬂnemde -fire—natural-disastes

d:
2s

A-copy-ofa-site-plan-depicting-the-totulnumber-of-all-buildings-within-the-complex;-including-a
deseription-of-the-use of each-building-and-the-location-of each-building-withinthe-complexs

£

The-total-numberot-dwelling-units:

ap

alarms-to-emergeney-serviees:

)

City of Groves

Page 19



368
369

370

371

372

373
374

375

376
377
378

379

380

381

382

383

384
385
386
387
388
389
390
391
392
393

394
395
396
397

398

Alandlord-commits-an-effense-if-the-landlord-knewingly-operates-a-multi-family-dwelling
complecudiich-iv-noteurrenthregistersdadth-die-butidineotlheiak

©)
Fees.
(D

The landlord of a multi-family dwelling complex shall pay the city fees to offset the city's costs
of administration, registration and inspection.

(€3]

An annual fee of nine-fifteen dollars and seventy five cents ($9:0015.75) per dwelling unit, with
a minimum of fifty-¢ighty seven dollars and fifty cents ($56:0087.50) per complex per year shall
be:

a.
Submitted annually with the registration form required by subsection (b)(5), and
b.

Submitted with a new registration upon a change of ownership of the complex.

3

The landlord of a multi-family dwelling complex that fails a periodic inspection shall eliminate
all violations identified at the time of the periodic inspection. The landlord must allow follow-up
inspections by the building official after a period of time determined by the building official to
be sufficient for the landlord to abate the violations. If the complex fails the first follow-up
inspection, the landlord shall pay the city a follow-up inspection fee of eighteen-thirty--one
dollars and fifty cents ($18-0031.50) per dwelling unit for the gross number of dwelling units
registered within the complex. No subsequent follow-up inspection fees shall be charged unless a
new periodic inspection is performed and the complex fails both the new periodic inspection and
the follow-up inspection. Follow-up inspection fees shall not be charged more than one time in
two (2) years.

“H
The fee-requirements desertbed-above-shatbnotincludea-dwelling unit-on a-cellege-university:
orsemaary-oceupied-by-astudentorastudent-and-the student's famibyv-and-in-which-the-dweling

unitis-owned-by-the-respective-college-university-orseminary:

)

City of Groves

Page 20



399

400

401

402

403

404

405
406

407

408

409

410

411

412
413

414

415

416

417

418

419

420

421
422

423

Inspection by building officiak

(37}

Periedic-inspections-and
ik
&

The-folowing-areas-ofa-multi-family-dweHing-complex-shall-be-subject-to-periodic-inspection
i ey v

a:
b:
B
d-

Oceupied-dwelling-units-upen-receiptof-complaint-by-the-untt's-tenant-during-a-periodie

)

City of Groves

Page 21



424
425
426

427

428
429
430
431
432
433

434

435
436

437

438
439

440

441
442
443

444

445
446
447
448

449

450
451
452
453
454

455

Execeptas-provi bseetion-(4)-below-the-butlding-otfieial-may-inspeet-portions-ofa-multi-
fapiy-dwelling-complex-as-frequently as-deemed-neeessaryThe-bulding-official-shallsehedule
odici A ; fagad “ommiiony

4

Exemption—-A-multi-family-dwelling-complex-whese-eriginal-construction-was-completed-on-or
| 2 A T —— il S E"E ;i P Il}msfism“ tl 1
a-complex—was-constructed-in-phases;-each-phase-shall-be-treated-as-a-separate-complex—for-th

a

The ownership-of-the-complex-changes—in-which-ease-an-inspection-pursuant-to-subseetion-(7)
shatb-be-maderor

b

The building-etfieiatreceives-avalid-complaintoforothervise-becomes-aware-of-avielation-of
hi el  the buildi l ; A5y

(53]
i Ittt smls- Sl dwalli . S~ - Cin
public-areas-and-all-vacant-dwelling-units-of the-complex-available-to-the-building-efficial-for

&)
. : i-family-dwelling

Iwelli ; : K
operating:The-complex-ineluding-all-oceupied-and-al-vacant-dwelling-units—shall-be-subjeet-to
5 : ; -y B Wiatlcing ol ek i

City of Groves

Page 22



456
457
458
459
460
461
462
463
464
465
466
467
468

469
470

471

472
473

474

475

476

477

478

479

480

481

482

483
484

Hthe-complexfuails-the-certificate-of oceupaney-inspection-allvacant-units-within-the-eomplex
5 3 5 i

b:

M%n&uﬂWMﬂeﬂWﬁumHmbwphﬂbme—mﬂanM

F ’ . . . N . 3 . ,. . e

. . . I. .

oceupies-passed-the-eertificate-of oceupaney-inspeetion:

When-the eccupancy-of-the-unit-changes:
&

Theland} hal b . | hall . . okl
tenant's- éweummum{—}ﬂh&wﬁaﬁ%dﬁacfeew&aﬂfneaheﬂ—maéeby%he Merd@n—the

City of Groves

Page 23



485

486
487

488
489
490
491

492
493

494

495
496

497
498
499
500
501
502
503
504
505
506
507
508
509
510
511
512

513
514

&)

The-building-official-shall determine-whichstundards-established-by-the-building-code-shall-be
eovercd-by-the-taspection:

&

The-fatlure of a-landlord-to-make-inspections-as-required-by-this-subsection-te-maintainrecords

of-the inspections—and-to-permit-inspeetion of those-records-pursuant-to-this-subseetionmay

dwelling-units-within-the-multi-family-dwelling-complex-

&

Fhereports-shatlvitherbe-on-aformprovided-by-the-building-olfichl oron-a-form-thet-comphies
with-the-requirements-herein:

b:

by the buildine official to-be-included within thei : nclude il
names-of all- persons-occupying the-dwelling unit-(Cother-than-evernight-guests):

e
+
The—namesaﬁdeﬁgﬂatedrempleyees—er etheﬁautheﬂzed—pefsem—whe—shau—be—asswaed—te

@QMAGF—"FHENE&GHBORH@OD-SER—\HGE&—DM& L@M—T—Qé@é#@%&i)éw

©

Thetandlerd-shatbmaintainthese-inspectonreports-on-tho-premises-ot-the-complex—and-shall
make-them-availablefor-inspeetion-at-all-reasonable-times—If-there-is-no-business-office-onthe

City of Groves

Page 24



515
516

517

518

519
520

521

522

523

524

525

526
527

528

529

530

531

532

533

534

535

536

537

538

539

premises-of the complex; the-landlord shall- maintain-reporis-at-the-landlord's-central-business
office-and-shalb-make them-avatlabletor-inspeetionat the-complex-at-all-reasenable-times:

&)

The-inspection-reports-shall-be-maintained-foramindmum of-three-(3)years:

‘[Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt ]

SECTION 8: - That Chapter 31, PLUMBING CODE, Sec. 103.4a Schedule of Permit Fees of [Formatted: Font: 12 pt ]

the Code of Ordinances. City of Groves, Texas, is hereby amended to increase the permit fees.

Said Sec. 103.4a Schedule of Permit Fees of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Groves. Texas

is hereby amended to read as follows:

" Sec. 103.4a Schedule of Permit Fees

[Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt ]

A

Chapter 31 - PLUMBING CODE
Sec. 31-2. - Amendments to the Uniform Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition.

Sec. 103.4.a. Schedule of Permit Fees.

On all plumbing installations or alterations requiring a plumbing permit, a fee for each plumbing
permit shall be paid as required at the time of filing the application in accordance with the fee
schedule as established herein.

FEE SCHEDULE

For issuing each permit .....$2035.00

Plus the following when provided:

Toilets, each .....$5.008.75

Tubs, each .....$5-008.75

Showers, each .....$5.008.75

Lavatories, each .....$5-:008.75

City of Groves Page 25



540

541

542

543

544

545

546

547

548

549

550

551

552

553

554

555

556

557

558

559

560

561

562

Water heaters, each .....$2035.00
Water service yard line .....$10-0617.50
Sewer service, yard line .....$2035.00

Floor drains, each .....$5-008.75

Washing machines, each .....$5-008.75

Air conditioner drain, each .....$5-:008.75

Drinking fountains, each .....$+0:8017.50
Grease trap/Interceptors, each .....$50-0087.50
Dishwasher, each .....$5:008.75

Sinks in cafe or restaurant:

2 compartments .....$5:008.75

3 compartments .....$7:0012.25

Mop sink, each .....$5:008.75

Soda fountain, each .....$10-0017.50
Steam tables, each .....$10-6017.50
Dental chairs, each .....$25-0043.75

RV parks, each space .....$56-:0087.50

jun
=}
w
o
22
o
w
%
v
©
g
|oe
~3
wn

City of Groves

Page 26



563  Over 5, each ....$5.008.75
564  QGas lines:

565  One (1) to four (4) outlets .....$25.0043.75

566  Each additional outlet .....$5-:008.75

567  Gas vented appliance, each .....$5:008.75
568  Backflow prevention assemblies:

569  Two inch and smaller, each .....$25.0043.75
570  Over two inch, each .....$50-0087.50

571  Gas Test .....$25:0043.75

572  Re-inspection .....$25-0043.75

573  Pool heater .....$25.0043.75

574  Generator .....$25:0043.75

575  Minimum on any plumbing inspection or reinspection .....$4670.00

576  Amend Section 103.4.4. Investigation Fees: Work Without a Permit by adding a new subsection
577  103.4.4.1.a. to read as follows.

578  Sec. 104.4.1.a. Work Without a Permit

579  Where work for which a permit is required by this Code is begun prior to obtaining said permit,
580 the fees shall be doubled, plus an additional administrative fee of $100175.00 shall be assessed
581  when the value of the construction-permit work-is less-than-$2,000100.00_or less. If the value of
582  the construction-permit werk-is $2:000100.00 or greater, the additional administrative fee

583  assessed shall be $500875.00. The payment of such double permit fee and the additional

584  administrative fee shall not relieve any person from fully complying with the requirements of
585  this Code in the execution of the work, nor from any other penalties prescribed herein.

586 . . [ Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt ]

587

588 SECTION 9: - That Chapter 32, MECHANICAL CODE, Sec. 32-2 Amendments, Sec. 106.5.2 [Formatted: Font: 12 pt ]

589  Fee schedule of the Code of Ordinances. City of Groves, Texas, is hereby amended to increase the

City of Groves Page 27



590

591

592

593
594
595
596

597

598

599

600

601

602

ermit fees. Said Sec. 106.5.2 Fee schedule of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Groves,

Texas is hereby amended to read as follows:

" Sec. 106.5.2 Fee schedule

Chapter 32 - MECHANICAL CODE
Sec. 32-2. - Amendments.

Sec. 106.5.2 Fees schedule shall be amended to read as follows:
Sec. 106.5.2 Fee schedule

Permit fees
New Construction Mechanical | $425.00 issuance/inspection fee plus $0.40/square foot for
Permxt Fee: total area under roof

Remodel/ Renovations
Mechanical Permit Fee:

Total-valuation Eees
\ Ne%e%mﬂess«mspee&emeqmwd—mwme#ease—a&&%
T fee—tm—eac#mspeene&shﬁtl—beehafgeé—

| $15.00-for the-first-$1,000.00-plus $5-00-for-each-additional
ﬂaeusand—er—l%&eﬂ%he{ee#&eaﬂéméﬂdmg&@@@@% ‘

$50-004-00-t0-5100-000.00 51:(’9 - fe* he-fiest$50,000:00 P*‘*’S $ ]' - “’Feae‘s e fd**"“*‘*g |

$230.00 issuance/inspection fee plus $0.20/square foot

i &%@@G—fb{—ﬁ*e—ﬁ;s&—&@%@@—@@—p&us%%—@@—fei—eaeh
$100:004-00-t6-$500.000-00 additional-thousand-or-fraction-thereof-to-and-ineluding
" M@O—M#ﬁ%@—@@@—@&p&uﬁ%@@—f&ﬁéﬁé f
R B l aéd*aenal%laeusaﬂd—er—tmeaeﬂ—thefeet- \

Section 108.4 Violation penalties shall be amended to read as follows:

Sec. 108 Violation penalties

City of Groves

- ﬁormatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt ]

Page 28



603
604
605
606
607
608
609
610
611

612
613

614

615

616

617

618

619

620

621

622

623

624
625

626

627

628

629

Where work for which a permit is required by this Code is begun prior to obtaining said permit,
the fees shall be doubled, plus an additional administrative fee of one hundred seventy five
dollars ($106175.00) shall be assessed when the value of the construction-permit work-is less
than-two-theusandone hundred dollars ($2;000100.00) or less. If the value of the construction
permit werk-is twe-theusandone hundred dollars ($2:066100.00) or greater, the additional
administrative fee assessed shall be five-cight hundred seventy five dollars ($560875.00). The
payment of such double permit fee and the additional administrative fee shall not relieve any
person from fully complying with the requirements of this Code in the execution of the work, nor
from any other penalties prescribed herein.

SECTION 10:, - Beginning October 1, 2024, the rates and charges set forth in this«.

. . . . . \
Ordinance shall be increased effective as of that date by an amount equal to the percentage increase

in_the Consumer Price Index for all Urban Consumers for All Items ("CPI"), as published by the

United States Bureau of Labor Statistics, from the immediately preceding fiscal vear times the rates

and charges in effect for the immediately preceding fiscal year, plus 25 percent. Beginning QOctober

1, 2025, and each anniversary thereafter, the rates and charges set forth in this Ordinance shall be

increased effective as of that date by an amount equal to the percentage increase in the Consumer

Price Index for all Urban Consumers for All Items ("CPI"), as published by the United States Bureau

of Labor Statistics, from the immediately preceding fiscal year times the rates and charges in effect

for the immediately preceding fiscal year.

SECTION 11: - That if any part of this ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid

or unconstitutional. the validity of the remaining portion shall not be affected thereby but shall remain

in full force and effect.

City of Groves

Condensed by 0.15 pt

- [Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt ]

[Formatted: Font: 12 pt ]

Formatted: Font: 12 pt, No underline, Condensed by
0.15 pt

Formatted: Font: 12 pt, Not Bold, No underline, ?

A Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,
.| Condensed by 0.15 pt

Formatted: Justified, Indent: Left: 0", Line spacing:
| Double, Don't hyphenate, Tab stops: -0.5", Left

[Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt ]

Page 29



630

631

632

633

634

635

636

637

638

639

640

641

642

643

644

645

646
647
648
649

650

SECTION 12: - That all ordinances or parts of ordinances or sections of the code or

parts of sections of the code in conflict with this section are hereby repealed but only to the exlent of

the conflict.

SECTION 13: - That this ordinance shall become a part of the Code of Ordinances

of' the City of Groves and may be codified therein accordingly.

SECTION 14: - That this ordinance shall be in effect with all billings afier the

beginning of the next Calendar year of the City, i.e. January 1, 2024,

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the City Council

of the City of Groves held on the 18th day of December 2023.

Chris Borne, Mayor
City of Groves

City of Groves

- [Formatted: Font: 12 pt

= "[Formatted: Font: 12 pt

[ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

v-"[Formatted: Font: 12 pt

Page 30



651
652
653
654
655

656

657

658
659

660

ATTEST:

Clarissa Thibodeaux, City Clerk

The foregoing ordinance, including all the provisions thereof, is hereby approved as

to form and legality.

Brandon P. Monk, City Attorney

City of Groves

= [ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

]

e '{Format!ed: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

)

Page 31



INVOICE APPROVAL LIST
December 18, 2023

1. Coy Development Heritage Point sub divider rebate. $5,563.68
INC.
2. Epic Engineering 2021 GLO CLFRF Grant for Water $103,425.72
and Wastewater SCADA upgrade.
3. Fuelman of Lafayette Gas and diesel for November 2023. $16,714.79
4. Jefferson County JCAD first quarter payment. $18,042.12
Appraisal District
5. Kontrol Automation, Startup of Centrifuge panel #1. Install of sludge $6,200.00
INC. pump vfd.
6. Soutex Surveyors, Payment #1 for Engineering services at the $17,500.00
INC. Wastewater Treatment Plant.
7. Texas Commission on Annual water system fee to operate the Water $17,485.65
Environmental Quality Piant.
8. Texas Pride Utilities Final pay application (2022-2023 CLFRF Pipe bursting) $216,878.95
TOTAL $401.810.91
City of Groves Page 32



P U R C H A S E ¢ R D E R

City of Groves

PURCHASE ORDER # 09-36212 12/06/2023
ISSUED TO: VEND #: 01-23238 SHIP TO:

COY DEVELOPMENT INC City of Groves City Hall
MIKE O'MEARA 3947 Lincoln Avenue
14803 OAK BLUFF CT Groves, TX 77619
HOUSTON, TX 77070 Purchasing Department

UNITS DESCRIPTION G/L. ACCOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

0.00 Heritage Point 11 -5-99~-07~580 SUBDIVIDER REBATES 0.00 5,563.68

Heritage Point subdivider rebate

RECEIVED
DEC 06 2073
FINANCE

*%* TOTAL *** 5,563.68

ORDERED BY: Lamar Ozley

APPROVED BY: LAMAR OZLEY

City of Groves Page 33



City of Groves, Texas
Subdivider Refund - Heritage Point/Rainbow Addition
12/01/2022 THRU 11/30/2023

Water Revenues Sewer Revenues
Address Collected 50% 50%

2703 EASTDALE| $ 213.56 $ 106.78 | $ 232.06 $ 116.03
2709 EASTDALE] $ 236.50 §$ 11825 ] $ 25500 $ 127.50
2715 EASTDALE] $§ 169.86 $ 8493 1% 183.55 § 91.78
2723 EASTDALE] $ 248.71 $ 12436 | $ 26721 $ 133.61
2735 EASTDALE] § 20949 §$ 104751 $ 216.89 $ 108.45
2745 EASTDALE] § 144.00 $ 72.00 | § 144.00 $ 72.00
2755 EASTDALE] $ 144.00 § 72.00 | $ 144.00 § 72.00
2763 EASTDALE] § 22170 $ 110.851 $ 24020 $ 120.10
2773 EASTDALE] § 27239 $ 13620 | $ 289.78 $ 144.89
2803 EASTDALE] $ 252.04 $ 126.02 § $§ 270.54 §$ 135.27
2804 EASTDALE] § 17434 § 87.171% 189.14 § 94.57
2807 EASTDALE] $ 43482 % 2174118 45332 §$ 226.66
2815 EASTDALE] $ 40744 $ 20372 $ 42483 $ 212.42
2722 TERRACE | $ 4043 $ 202219 40.69 $ 20.35
2732 TERRACE | § 578.01 § 289.01 1 $ 596.51 $ 298.26
2742 TERRACE | § 24353 $ 121771 $ 262.03 § 131.02
2747 TERRACE | § 401.15 $ 200.58 | $ 41965 $ 209.83
2750 TERRACE | $ 153.62 § 7681 1% 157.32 $ 78.66
2805 TERRACE | $ 21282 §$ 106.41 | $ 23132 § 115.66
2806 TERRACE | § 172.49 § 86251 $ 189.88 $ 94.94
2812 TERRACE | § 24834 §$ 124171 $ 266.84 $ 133.42
2815 TERRACE | § 229.02 $ 114511 $ 24434 $ 122.17
Total $ 540826 $ 2,704.13 $ 5,719.10 $ 2,859.55
Rebate

Total Collected $11,127.36
Remaining Balance

Date Check # Amount

6/28/2019 64783 $ 2,301.18

1/17/2020 66304 $ 2,191.99

12/4/2020 68759 $ 4,834.31

12/3/2021 71613 $ 4,938.50

12/2/2022 74575 $ 6,386.71

$ 5,563.68

City of Groves

Bal. Fwd
$ 202,347.32

$ (5,563.68)

$ 196,783.64

Page 34



PURCHASING DOCUMENT FOR QUOTES ONLY

City of Groves, Dept. of Public Works and Engineering

DATE: December 07,2023 P.O. NUMBER: r09-35468 J
TO: Lance Billeaud Keviv Cactuth FROM: David Molbert

Purchase Recommendation

Recommended Company: EPIC ENGINEERING
Items to be Purchased: SCADA improvements
ITEM DESC. QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST
Order Acceptance: Material Purchasing & 1 $103,425.72 | $103,425.72
Licensing 20% $0.00
1 $0.00
$0.00
* Note: Purchases greater than $5000.00 Require Council approval before ordering! $103’125'72

REASONS FOR PURCHASE:
7021 GLO CLRF Grant for Water/Waste water Scada and Upgrade

QUOTES
COMPANY NAME COST

o P |5 1P |0

N S o

CHARGE NUMBER: 11-5-67-09-604 VENDOR NUMBER: 01-23383

Requested by: M W Date: /2-7-23

Approved by: ,:O/% Date: 12720 y 5
(PW Director) o~ " t R E E IVED
Approved by: ate:
(City Manager) DEC 0 7 20 23
Date Council Approved
FINANCE

C:\Users\GRVWTP\Desktop\Council Approval.doc

City of Groves b
age 35



Nov. 2023
FUELMAN
VENDOR # 6725
B 01-5-02-07-050 $

01-5-31-02-030 $ 4,128.05
01-5-32-02-030 S 1,192.09
| 01-5-33-02-030 S 154.63
| 01-5-38-02-030 $ 232.00
| |01-5-41-02-030 $ =
i 01-5-42-02-030 S 87.44
- 101-5-44-02-030 $ 1,592.60

| 01-5-45-02-030 $ -
01-5-46-02-030 S 638.10
- [ 05-5-55-02-030 $ - 7,173.71
| 11-5-63-02-030 $ 98.77
| ~11-5-64-02-030 $ 103.78
- 11-5-66-02-030 $ =
11-5-67-02-030 $ 1,313.62

] 11-5-68-02-030 $ -
| L TOTAL | S B 16,714.79
| h\l ﬁ‘fg‘.&};

City of Groves

Page 36



™ Fuelman

PO BOX 1239
COVINGTON, LA 70434

Local Office: Lafayette

For billing questions call: (800) 877-0800

CITY OF GROVES
ATTN: JOHN SPIKES
3947 LINCOLN AVE
GROVES TX 77619-4604

> [ANVART A

Account Number:

217874

Please reference account # on all payments

Statement # NP65577178
Statement Date 12/04/2023
Current Balance $16,714.79
Amount Due on 01/03/2024 $16,714.79

Customer Statement Activity: 11/1/2023 - 11/30/2023

Previous Statement Payments & Purchases & Fees & New Balance
Balance Credits Adjustments Charges* Due
$21,160.36 ($21,160.36) $16,714.79 $1,887.37 $16,714.79
Current Activity *Fees & Charges is included in Purchases & Adjustments

11/27/2023 PAYMENT: Lockbox Payment -

Thank You

12/4/2023 Fleet # 228771 Name: CITY OF

GROVES

(21,160.36)

16,714.79

Fees

Accelerator Rewards Elite
Extended Network Pricing
Fraud Protector Fee
Monthly Billing Cycle Fee
Regular Package Fee
Tax Exempt Filing Fee

540.00

30.00
360.00
270.00
539.10
148.27

& P P P PP

PLEASE INCLUDE ONLY CHECK AND REMITTANCE COPY BELOW IN THE ENVELOPE PROVIDED. REMITTANCES ARE TRANSMITTED TO FLEETCOR

TREASURY, COVINGTON, LA. ANY ADDITIONAL CORRESPONDENCE SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE ADDRESS IN THE TOP LEFT AREA OF THIS STATEMENT.

REMITTANCE COPY — RETURN THIS STUB WITH PAYMENT

™ Fuelman

Amount Due on 01/03/2024

$16,714.79

PAYMENT AMOUNT | $

0ooo00000DOO0O00R227?874700006712,4797

City of Groves

Account # 217874

CITY OF GROVES
ATTN: JOHN SPIKES
3947 LINCOLN AVE
GROVES TX 77619

REMIT TO:

FUELMAN
PO Box 70887

Charlotte NC 28272-0887

Page 37



™ Fuelman

PO BOX 1239 FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT
COVINGTON, LA 70434 Account # 217874
FLEET # 228771
Provided By: Name: CITY OF GROVES
v P MATCHING STATEMENT #  NP65577178
Page: 10f 18

CITY OF GROVES
ATTN: JOHN SPIKES
3947 LINCOLN AVE
GROVES TX 77619

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT FOR 11/1/2023 - 11/30/2023
SUMMARY OF TRANSACTIONS THIS REPORTING PERIOD FOR ALL VEHICLES IN YOUR FLEET

PRODUCT QUANTITY BASE PRICE FED TAX ST TAX OTHTAX OTH CHARGES TOTAL
UE10 2,673.698 $6,618.47 $17.50 $505.38 $0.00 $7,174.14
PE10 10.960 $34.18 $0.07 $2.20 $0.00 $36.45
ME10 10.448 $28.41 $0.07 $2.10 $0.00 $30.58
UDSL* 2,092.649 $7,151.25 $14.28 $408.57 $0.00 $7,586.25
OTHER CHARGES $1,887.37 $1,887.37
Total 4,787.755 $13,832.31 $31.92 $918.25 $0.00 $1,887.37 $16,714.79
Tax Exempt Filing Fee $148.27|
Extended Network Pricing $30.00
Fraud Protector Fee $360.00|
Accelerator Rewards Elite $540.00|

Regular Package Fee $539.1

Monthly Billing Cycle Fee $270.0

Report Total $16,714.7

This report is for information only.
Please see remittance copy on the statement for the total payment amount.

TOTAL MILES: 27,935
*This diesel fuel does not contain visible evidence of dye.

DEPARTMENTAL SUMMARIES

DEPT BASE FED STATE | LOCAL | MAINT/OTH | EXTENDED |EXCEPT
DREMITEMENT Bewe NUM ary PRICE | TAXES | TAXES | TAXES | (Non-Fuel) | TOTAL |COUNT

No Department 0l 2692312]  7,80491 18.15 521.03 0.00 0.00] _ 8,364.60 0
25 - PARKS & RECREATION | 724280, 71.969 178.72 0.36 10.38 0.00 0.00 193.69 0
31- POLICE DEPARTMENT | 724301]  592.873]  1,447.91 3.80 11.14 0.00 000 1,571.04 1
32 - FIRE DEPARTMENT 724303]  296.229 849.13 1.88 54.56 0.00 0.00 910.66 6
44 - STREET DEPARTMENT | 724281 10.496 35.77 0.07 211 0.00 0.00 37.95 0
46-FACILITIES MAINTENANCE | 089365] 53204 130.32 0.37 10.69 0.00 0.00 141.38 0
55 - SOLIDWASTE DEPARTMENT | 724297]  753.495]  2.572.96 5.29 151.33 0.00 0.0 2.729.58 3
63- WATER PLANT 983388]  33.093 80.73 0.24 6.65 0.00 0.00 87.62 i
64 - WASTEWATER PLANT | 724298 33.569 85.08 0.24 6.74 0.00 0.00 92.06 0
67 - WATER DISTRIBUTION | 724299 146.296 393.99 0.79 32.67 0.00 0.00 424.37 0
Garage 1256811 104.219 252.79 0.73 20.95 0.00 0.00 274.47] 0

EXCEPTION CODES:

3 Veh is restricted from purchasing this fuel
5 Vehicle has exceeded its cycle fuel limit
11 Odometer entry is out of sequence

City of Groves Page 38



| Fuelman

PO BOX 1239
COVINGTON, LA 70434

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account # 217874
FLEET # 228771
Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 30f18
FUEL NET TOTAL  EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE__ DRIVER ODOMETER MPG _ TYPE QTY PRICE _ TAXES AMT CODE**
59 — 2021 Freightliner (continued)
11/07 14:03 556741 Matthew Mc 26828 30  UDSL* 18.882 3.44770  0.20788 $69.03
11/08 14:09 556741 WOODS CLIN 26892 33  UDSL* 19.349  3.40740  0.20788 $69.96
11/09 13:53 556741 WOODS CLIN 26969 43  UDSL* 17.775  3.40760  0.20788 $64.28
113 13:47 556741 WOODS CLIN 27039 40  UDSL* 17423 340760  0.20788 $63.00
11/14 13:39 556741 WOODS CLIN 27103 36  UDSL* 18.002 3.40800  0.20788 $65.10
11/15 14:27 556741 WOODS CLIN 27167 40  UDSL* 15877 3.40810  0.20788 $57.41
11/16 11:04 556741 WOODS CLIN 27199 32  UDSL* 10.134  3.40730  0.20788 $36.64
11/20 13:51 556741 WOODS CLIN 27291 44  UDSL* 20.944 340810  0.20788 $75.73
11/21 10:12 556613 WOODS CLIN 145189 0.0  UDSL* 41219 340790  0.20788  $149.04
11/21 12:37 556741 WOODS CLIN 27348 00  UDSL* 13.015 3.40840  0.20788 $47.06 11
11/22 13:26 556741 WOODS CLIN 27406 32  UDSL* 18170  3.40780  0.20788 $65.70
11127 14:47 556741 Matthew Mc 27477 39  UDSL* 17.988 340780  0.20788 $65.05
11/28 14:34 556741 Matthew Mc 27551 33  UDSL* 22420 334790  0.20788 $79.72
11/30 12:52 556741 Matthew Mc 27623 30  UDSL* 24205 3.34850  0.20788 $86.07 Sz
Miles: 1029 3.7 329.691 $1192.26 B/
63 — 2008 FORD RANGER
11/03 08:44 556741 Nick Tran 116374 132  UE10 10.640 250750  0.20788 $28.89
11/08 08:00 556741 Nick Tran 116472 103 UE10 9542 250680  0.20788 $25.91
11/10 08:18 556613 Nick Tran 116579 129  UE10 8277 246830  0.20788 $22.16
11115 08:53 556613 Nick Tran 116712 123 UE10 10.854 2.40830  0.20788 $28.39
11/20 07:50 556741 Nick Tran 116824 113  UE10 9.912 240820  0.20788 $25.93
11/22 14:02 556613 Nick Tran 116975 144  UE10 10458 240960  0.20788 $27.37
11/29 08:58 556741 Nick Tran 117120 146 UE10 9.929 236680  0.20788 $2557 | 1
Miles: 886  12.7 69.612 $184.22 lﬂ
72 — 2001 FORD F150 PU
11/08 12:10 556613 MAYEA, ADA 50408 129  UE10 23195 246860  0.20788 $62.08
11/30 12:00 556613 MAYEA, ADA 59708 132 _ UE10 22753 2.36850  0.20788 $58.62
Miles: 600  13.1 45.948 $120.70 3 s
91 — 2008 F250 SUPER DUTY
11/22 10:23 927808 BREAUX, JO 85057  45.8 UE10 11790 2.50810  0.20788 $32.02 4’
Miles: 540 45.8 11.790 $32.02 L.L
CRWN VIC - 2010 Crown Vic Unit 4
11/02 12116 556613 STEVEN DOD 93654 106 UE10 11.847 250780  0.20788 $32.17
11/20 11:58 556613 STEVEN DOD 93780 115 UE10 10.944 240860  0.20788 $2863 4
Miles: 251 114 22.791 $60.80 P j
E6 - 05 PERICE
11/20 09:13 556741 HADEN GROV 119778 0.0 _ UDSL* 27100 3.40780  0.20788 $97.99
Miles: e 27.100 $97.99 52
GRADELL - 1998 GRADELL
11/07 12:19 556613 Julian Mel 17452 0.0  UDSL* 40472 344830 020788 _ $147.97 )
Miles:  — 40.472 $147.97 q‘H
MOWER - 04 TORO MOWER
11/09 07:26 556613 JUSTIN TRE 1215 0.3 UE10 31.001 2.46800  0.20788 $85.36 Vg
Miles: 10 3 31.901 sssa6 - (0
RESCUE - RESCUE
11/20 09:25 556741 JOSHUA HI 24033 5.1 uDSL* 12255 340840  0.20788 $44.32 <
Miles: 62 5.4 12.255 sa32 5 o
Street Dpt — 1999 F350 Dully WHite
11/01 08:16 556741 MOORE, DAR 4208 114  UDSL* 57.323 3.44820 020788  $209.57
11/06 1129 556613 MOORE, DAR 77084 0.0 UE10 22260 2.50850  0.20788 $60.47
11127 08:17 556613 MOORE, DAR 77316 102  UE10 22681 240820  0.20788 $59.34
11/30 13:31 556613 MOORE, DAR 77530 106 UE10 20.117  2.36820  0.20788 $51.82 ‘
_ Miles: 1101 10.7 122.381 $381.20 L\(LP
City of Groves Page 39



™ Fuelman

PO BOX 1239
COVINGTON, LA 70434 FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT
Account # 217874
FLEET # 228771
Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 4 of 18
FUEL NET TOTAL  EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE  DRIVER ODOMETER  MPG TYPE QTY PRICE TAXES AMT CODE**
unit 10 — 2017 Ford Explorer
11/04 18:36 556613 Nicholas A 90551 3.6 UE10 8.881  2.50760 0.20788 $24.12
11/05 22:01 556741 Nicholas A 90598 4.8 UE10 9.859  2.50940 0.20788 $26.79
11/07 04:08 556741 Nicholas A 90660 5.0 UE10 12.484  2.50800 0.20788 $33.91
11/13 19:53 927808 Nicholas A 90694 35 UE10 9.714  2.56740 0.20788 $26.96
11/14 19:10 927808 Nicholas A 90726 53 UE10 6.095 256770 0.20788 $16.92
11/15 19:18 402759  Justin Jus 90730 1.2 UE10 3.459 251230 0.20788 $9.40
11/16 20:06 556741 Justin Jus 90766 5.3 UE10 6.731 2.40680 0.20788 $17.61
1117 02:44 556613 Justin Jus 90814 9.7 UE10 4.947  2.40750 0.20788 $12.93 3
Miles: 295 4.8 62.170 $168.64 {
Unit 11 — 2017 Ford Explorer
11/03 16:02 556741 Richard Po 71630 74 UE10 8.750 2.50860 0.20788 $23.77
11/06 13:16 556741 Richard Po 71713 6.2 UE10 13.357  2.50960 0.20788 $36.29
11/07 16:51 556741 Richard Po 71804 8.3 UE10 10.961  2.50890 0.20788 $29.77
1117 08:05 556741 Richard Po 71869 45 UE10 14.530 2.40810 0.20788 $38.01
1119 13:18 556741 Richard Po 71945 5.1 UE10 15.025 240730 0.20788 $39.30
11/21 09:32 556741 Richard Po 72021 5.6 UE10 13.639  2.40780 0.20788 $35.67
11/25 19:30 556741 Richard Po 72116 6.3 UE10 15.162  2.40870 0.20788 $39.67
11/28 12:21 556741 Richard Po 72203 6.6 UE10 13.192 2.36890 0.20788 $33.99 ) .,
Miles: 638 6.3 104.616 $276.47 7
Unit 12 — 2015 Explorer
1116 11:12 927808 PHILLIPS, 121746 8.3 UE10 14.164  2.56850 0.20788 $39.32
11/28 11:40 927808 PHILLIPS, 121827 7.6 UE10 10.618  2.46940 0.20788 $28.42 e
Miles: 198 8.0 24.782 $67.74 /3 )
UNIT 12 — 2020 Ford Exporer
11/10 21:30 556613 DAVID HANC 22942 75 UE10 11.796  2.46860 0.20788 $31.57
1112 18:54 556741 DAVID HANC 23021 7.2 PE10 10.960 3.11860 0.20788 $36.45 3
11/16 17:55 556741 DAVID HANC 23074 4.9 UE10 10.726  2.40820 0.20788 $28.06
11/22 20:15 556741 DAVID HANC 23158 6.9 UE10 12.102  2.40790 0.20788 $31.66 ”
Miles: 305 6.6 45.584 $12774 O
UNIT 2 - 2006 CROWN VIC
11/02 12:17 556613 JOHN, HUDS 150125 11.4 UE10 17.506  2.50770 0.20788 $47.55
11/16 08:05 556741 JOHN, HUDS 150330 12.9 UE10 15.931 2.40790 0.20788 $41.67 2
Miles: 405 122 33.437 $89.22 ol
UNIT 4 — 2020 FORD EXPLORER
11/03 17:29 556741 Christophe 49231 3.6 UE10 6.035 2.50700 0.20788 $16.39
11/06 17:41 556741 Christophe 49245 3.6 UE10 3.935 250570  0.20788 $10.68
11/07 16:41 556741 Christophe 49264 5.2 UE10 3670 251230  0.20788 $9.97
11/09 16:22 556741 Christophe 49297 6.6 UE10 5035 246670  0.20788 $13.47
11/14 16:19 556741 Christophe 49357 4.0 UE10 14.852  2.40910 0.20788 $38.86
11/15 16:06 556613 STEVEN DOD 49394 5.7 UE10 6.495 2.40650 0.20788 $16.99
11/16 16:58 556613 Christophe 49447 7.9 UE10 6.693  2.40700 0.20788 $17.51
11/26 18:38 556613 STEVEN DOD 49552 10.0 UE10 10456  2.40910 0.20788 $27.36
11/27 04:19 556613 STEVEN DOD 49606 9.9 UE10 5458  2.40930 0.20788 $14.28
11/29 00:45 556613 STEVEN DOD 49729 10.8 UE10 11.411 2.36880 0.20788 $29.39 P
Miles: 520 6.7 74.040 $194.90 O i
Unit 42 - 2017 Mack Garbage Truck
11/06 09:39 556741 BULLOCKM 63032 0.6 UDSL* 28.538  3.44840  0.20788 $104.34
11/29 13:49 556741 Matthew Mc 63211 3.6 uDSL* 50.014  3.34810 0.20788 $177.85 s
Miles: 197 21 78.552 $282.19 3 D
Unit 48 — 2010 Limb Picker
11/02 07:35 556741 PATE, WAYN 142325 6.5 uDSL* 21.714  3.44800  0.20788 $79.38
11/03 09:42 556741 PATE, WAYN 142431 4.2 uDSL* 24.990 344860  0.20788 $91.37
1113 11:02 556741 Matthew Mc 142528 5.2 UDSL* 18.505 3.40770  0.20788 $66.91
11/21 1212 556741 Matthew Mc 142600 1.6 uDSL* 44978 3.40810  0.20788 $162.64

City of Groves Page 40



™ Fuelman

PO BOX 1239
COVINGTON, LA 70434

DATE TIME SITE  DRIVER
unit 81 — 2020 F150 WATER BILLING

___ODOMETER __MPG

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account # 217874
FLEET # 228771
Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 6 of 18
MR o M e R U

11/14 0924 556613 Nick Potte 19495 0.0 UE10 20.325 2.40790  0.20788 $53.17 11
Miles: e 20.325 $53.17 }Uﬂ
Unit 92 - 08 FORD F-150
11/09 11:29 556579 CATHEY, PA 96265  13.2 UE10 21794 250760  0.20788 $59.19
11/30 07:56 556579 CATHEY, PA 96407 8.0 UE10 17.783 240790  0.20788 $46.53
Miles: 43  10.6 39.577 $105.72 4 L
UNIT2 - 2011 FORD F150
11/02 08:223 556741 HADEN GROV 53039  10.8 UE10 18.041 250760  0.20788 $49.00
11/20 13:39 556741 HADEN GROV 53155 115 UE10 10.124  2.40810  0.20788 $26.48
Miles: 310 112 28.165 $7548 D -
UNIT28 — 2006 FORD F550 PATCH TRUCK
11/02 09:47 556613 Howard Zac 107505 6.7 UDSL* 19.215 3.44780  0.20788 $70.25
Miles: 128 6.7 19.215 $7025 1 Y4
UNIT51 — 2006 F-350 4 DOOR
11/10 07:30 556613 PATE, WAYN 83036 4.2 UDSL* 12.987 3.40800  0.20788 $46.96
Miles: 55 4.2 12.987 $4696 44
UNIT70 — 2010 F150 P/U
11/02 10:48 556613 Cory Sande 119609 8.9 UE10 21.824 250830  0.20788 $59.28
11/14 13:07 556613 Cory Sande 119863 11.1 UE10 22.850 2.40830  0.20788 $59.78
Miles: 448 10.0 44.674 $119.06 1%4_
UNIT77 — 2020 F150 INSPECTIONS
11/01 13:32 556613 DON PEDRAZ 14932 143 UE10 16.546 250820  0.20788 $44.93
11/28 14:39 556613 DON PEDRAZ 15150  14.0 UE10 15,503  2.36840  0.20788 $40.17 32
Miles: 454  14.2 32.139 $85.10
Department: UE10 1443.010 $3,840.59
PE10  10.960 $36.45
ME10  10.448 $30.58
UDSL* 1227.894 $4,456.98
Department Totals - 2692.312 $8,364.60
SITE LEGEND
SITE#  SITE NAME ADDRESS CITY STATE
311438 Ice Box #4969 5770 W Port Arthur Rd Port Arthur >
402759 Yogi Exxon 6101 Guifway Dr Groves TX
556579 Exxpress Mart #29 1650 W Cardinal Dr Beaumont X
556613 Exxpress Mart #27 3911 Pure Atlantic Rd Groves X
5566741 Exxpress Mart #26 5410 W Parkway St Groves X
927808 B&b Mini Mart #2 3301 Cleveland Ave Groves TX

City of Groves

Page 41



™ Fuelman

PO BOX 1239
COVINGTON, LA 70434

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account # 217874
FLEET # 228771
Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 7 of 18

Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 228771 — CITY OF GROVES; 11/1/2023 — 11/30/2023

Department: 25 - PARKS & RECREATION

SubDepartment: No Sub-Department

FUEL NET TOTAL  EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE  DRIVER ODOMETER MPG TYPE QTYy PRICE TAXES AMT CODE**
Dodge13 — 2001 Dodge Pick-Up
11/03 07:27 556613 Cory Sande 77723 85 UE10 20.327  2.50800 0.20788 $55.21
11/07 11:15 556613 Kolby Schu 77841 5.7 UE10 20.542  2.50800 0.20788 $55.79
1113 07:33 556613 Nick Potte 77910 3.1 UE10 22436  2.46750 0.20788 $60.03
11/28 07:21 556613 Kolby Schu 77938 3.2 UE10 8.664  2.40770 0.20788 $22.66 P
Miles: 286 3.9 71.969 $193.69 \_p \
Department: 25 - PARKS & RECREATION UE10 71.969 $193.69
Department Totals - 71.969 $193.69
SITE LEGEND
SITE # SITE NAME ADDRESS CITY STATE
556613 Exxpress Mart #27 3911 Pure Atlantic Rd Groves X

City of Groves

Page 42



o)

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

= Fuelman Account # 217874
PO BOX 1239 FLEET # 228771
GOVINGTON, LA 70434 Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 8 of 18
Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 228771 — CITY OF GROVES; 11/1/2023 - 11/30/2023
Department: 31 - POLICE DEPARTMENT
SubDepartment: No Sub-Department
FUEL NET TOTAL  EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE _ DRIVER ODOMETER MPG  TYPE Qry PRICE  TAXES AMT CODE*
1 - 05 FORD EXPEDITION
11/09 07:23 556613 JUSTIN TRE 109936 7.7 UE10 14756  2.46880  0.20788 $39.49
11/15 10:14 556613 JUSTIN TRE 110105 8.9 UE10 19.018 240820  0.20788 $49.75
11/28 11:18 556613 Garrett Hi 110267 7.8 UE10 20.644 2.36780  0.20788 $63.17
Miles: 444 81 54.418 $14241 L ‘e
UNIT 01 — 2020 FORD EXPLORER
11/01 18:46 556613 Macie Berg 47946  10.6 UE10 8221 250820  0.20788 $22.33
11/03 0513 556741 Macie Berg 48098  12.2 UE10 12.509 250780  0.20788 $33.97
11/09 20117 556741 Macie Berg 48248 99 UE10 15224  2.46780  0.20788 $40.73
11/11 20:53 556741 Macie Berg 488369 0.0 UE10 12.984 246770  0.20788 $34.74
11/13 04:38 556741 Macie Berg 48503 0.0 UE10 11.235 246820  0.20788 $30.06 11
11/16 23:49 556741 Macie Berg 48671  13.0 UE10 12.968 240900  0.20788 $33.93
11/24 19:37 556741 Macie Berg 48841 107 UE10 15934 240810  0.20788 $41.68
11/26 18:48 556741 Macie Berg 49003 125 UE10 12.993 240820  0.20788 $33.99
11/29 19:56 556741 Macie Berg 49080  10.8 UE10 7.145 236530  0.20788 $18.40 3
Miles: 966  11.4 109.213 $289.83 4
UNIT 09 — 2020 FORD EXPLORER
11/02 08:32 402759 ALEX THIBO 60092  13.3 UE10 17.446 260750  0.20788 $49.13
11/04 03:11 556613 RUDY GUERR 60244 113 UE10 13.404 250900  0.20788 $36.41
11/05 21:31 556613 RUDY GUERR 60391  11.0 UE10 13.376  2.50820  0.20788 $36.33
11/07 22:24 556613 RUDY GUERR 60502 8.1 UE10 13.650 2.50920  0.20788 $37.08
11113 17:42 556613 RUDY GUERR 60597 9.1 UE10 10.483 240770  0.20788 $27.42
11/15 10:48 556613 ALEX THIBO 60766  10.6 UE10 15.951  2.40860  0.20788 $41.73
11/18 03:01 556613 ALEX THIBO 60916  10.1 UE10 14906 240840  0.20788 $38.99
11/20 18:10 556613 RUDY GUERR 61008 6.4 UE10 14277 240810  0.20788 $37.35
11/23 11:49 402759 RUDY GUERR 61210  13.9 UE10 14.542 240820  0.20788 $38.04
11/27 20:29 556613 RUDY GUERR 61347  10.3 UE10 13.303 240850  0.20788 $34.80 A
11/29 12:33 556741 ALEX THIBO 61526 12.0 UE10 14.902  2.36810  0.20788 $3838 19 )
Miles: 1666  10.6 156.240 $415.66
Unit 6 — 22 Explorer
11/01 17:30 556741 Jennifer M 15104 7.2 UE10 10538 2.50810  0.20788 $28.62
11/04 09:10 556613 Laranda Pi 15175 5.2 UE10 13538 250780  0.20788 $36.76
11/06 08:19 556613 Laranda Pi 15223 4.5 UE10 10.616  2.50850  0.20788 $28.83
11/07 14:06 556613 Laranda Pi 15256 4.0 UE10 8220 250850  0.20788 $22.33
11/08 22:54 556613 Laranda Pi 15394  10.1 UE10 13.612 246910  0.20788 $36.43
11/09 17:10 556741 Jennifer M 15474 8.7 UE10 9.181 246710  0.20788 $24.57
1112 15:27 556741 Jennifer M 15604 8.1 UE10 16.002 2.46840  0.20788 $42.82
1114 15:23 556613 Laranda Pi 15666 5.9 UE10 10.548 240800  0.20788 $27.59
11/19 06:37 556741 Laranda Pi 15760 6.5 UE10 14416 240840  0.20788 $37.71
11/20 16:08 556613 Laranda Pi 15849 7.9 UE10 11210 240950  0.20788 $29.33
11/22 19:34 556741 LarandaPi 15949 6.8 UE10 14.669 240920  0.20788 $38.38
11/26 16:16 556741 Jennifer M 16030 55 UE10 14.661 240910  0.20788 $38.36
11/28 15:56 556613 Laranda Pi 16104 75 UE10 9.874 236780  0.20788 $25.43
11/29 22:57 556613 Laranda Pi 16193 8.3 UE10 10.749 236770  0.20788 $27.68
Miles: 1165 6.9 167.834 $aa484 4 |
Unit 8 — 22 Explorer
11/04 10:54 556613 JoshuaLyn 9386 8.9 UE10 13583 2.50830  0.20788 $36.89
11/06 08:55 556613 JoshuaLyn 9503 9.5 UE10 12.346 250770  0.20788 $33.53
11/07 16:20 556613 Joshua Lyn 9590 83 UE10 10.507 2.50880  0.20788 $28.54
11114 13:54 556613 Joshua Lyn 9684 8.6 UE10 10.987 240830  0.20788 $28.74
11118 07:21 556613 JoshuaLyn 9778 89 UE10 10.559 240930  0.20788 $27.63
11/23 06:42 556613 Joshua Lyn 9911 8.3 UE10 16.072 240920  0.20788 $42.05
11/26 0524 556613 JoshuaLyn 9972 47 UE10 13.101 240820  0.20788 $34.27
11/26 17:12 556613 Laranda Pi 10014 6.9 UE10 6.080 240790  0.20788 $15.91
11/28 16:51 556613 Joshua Lyn 10089 6.3 UE10 11.933  2.36740  0.20788 $30.74 -~ |
Miles: 824 7.8 105.168 $27830 o |
City of Groves Page 43



™ Fuelman

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account # 217874
PO BOX 1239 FLEET # 228771
COVINGTON, LA 70434 Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 10 of 18
Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 228771 — CITY OF GROVES; 11/1/2023 - 11/30/2023
Department: 32 - FIRE DEPARTMENT
SubDepartment: No Sub-Department
FUEL NET TOTAL EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE DRIVER ODOMETER  MPG TYPE QTy PRICE TAXES AMT CODE**
2022 F150 - Unit 103
11/03 08:05 556613 Steven Esq 10969 13.9 UE10 8.942  2.50730 0.20788 $24.28
11/09 16:38 556613 Steven Esq 1124 0.0 UE10 13.570  2.46940 0.20788 $36.32 11
1117 10:39 556613 Jared Grai 24171 0.0 UE10 16.561 2.40860 0.20788 $40.71
11/22 07:57 556613 Jared Grai 11431 0.0 UE10 13.708  2.40880 0.20788 $35.86 11
Miles: 124 13.9 51.781 $13717 ) 2
| A
2022 F250 — Rescue 37 27
1111 05:36 556741 SHEPPARD, 6534 9.6 UE10 23.124  2.46840 0.20788 $61.88
11/15 06:33 556741 HADEN GROV 6615 5.8 UE10 13.972  2.40910 0.20788 $36.55
11/19 12:37 556741 Cole White 6712 5.7 UE10 17.045 2.40720 0.20788 $44.58
11/24 21:48 556613 TRAHAN, C. 6500 0.0 UE10 19.436  2.40740 0.20788 $50.84 11
11/27 16:57 556741 TRAHAN, C. 6008 0.0 UE10 9.755  2.40800 0.20788 $25.52 N
Miles: 400 7.0 83.332 $219.37 4
Unit 1 — 2012 F150 XLt pick up truck
11/08 09:25 556741 HADEN GROV 57987 14.3 UE10 18.945 2.50780 0.20788 $51.45
11/27 09:56 556741 TRAHAN, C. 58133 12.8 UE10 11409  2.40860 0.20788 $29.84
Miles: 416 13.6 30.354 $81.29 )
2
UNIT# 3 — 2012 PIERCE PUMPER AL
11/08 19:33 556613 HADEN GROV 21879 0.0 UDSL* 28.309  3.40810 0.20788 $102.36
1113 14:51 556741 Cole White 21918 2.1 UDSL* 18.624  3.40800 0.20788 $67.34
11/20 09:50 556741 HADEN GROV 29465 0.0 ubsL* 14,152  3.40870 0.20788 $51.18
11/27 17:08 556741 JOSH NELSO 22002 0.0 uDsSL* 24.645  3.40800 0.20788 $89.11 "
Miles: 39 241 85.730 $300.99
UNIT# 5 — 2012 PIERCE PUMPER )
11/20 09:39 556741 HADEN GROV 3858 0.0 uDSL* 30.679  3.40820 0.20788 $110.94 11
11/27 17:20 556741 JOSH NELSO 23515 0.0 uDsSL* 14.353  3.40840 0.20788 $51.90
Miles: e 45.032 $162.84 / 2
Department: 32 - FIRE DEPARTMENT UE10  165.467 $437.83
UDSL* 130.762 $472.83
Department Totals -  296.229 $910.66
SITE LEGEND
SITE # SITE NAME ADDRESS CITY STATE
556613 Exxpress Mart #27 3911 Pure Atlantic Rd Groves TX
556741 Exxpress Mart #26 5410 W Parkway St Groves ™
City of Groves Page 44



™ Fuelman

PO BOX 1239
COVINGTON, LA 70434

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account # 217874
FLEET # 228771
Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 11 of 18

Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 228771 — CITY OF GROVES; 11/1/2023 - 11/30/2023

Department: 44 - STREET DEPARTMENT

SubDepartment: No Sub-Department

FUEL NET TOTAL  EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE _ DRIVER ODOMETER _MPG __ TYPE QTY PRICE  TAXES AMT CODE*
23 — 2007 F650 DUMP
11/28 07:32 556613 Julian Mel 36684 6.2 UDSL* 10496  3.40800  0.20788 $37.95
Miles: 65 6.2 10.496 $37.95 LJM
Department: 44 - STREET DEPARTMENT UDSL*  10.496 $37.95
Department Totals - 10.496 $37.95
SITE LEGEND
SITE#  SITE NAME ADDRESS CITY STATE
556613 Exxpress Mart #27 3911 Pure Atlantic Rd Groves X
City of Groves Page 45



PO BOX 1239
COVINGTON, LA 70434

! Fuelman

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account # 217874
FLEET # 228771
Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 12 of 18

Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 228771 — CITY OF GROVES; 11/1/2023 - 11/30/2023

Department: 46-FACILITIES MAINTENANCE

SubDepartment: No Sub-Department

FUEL NET TOTAL EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE DRIVER ODOMETER _ MPG TYPE QTY PRICE TAXES AMT CODE**
17 — 05 FORD EXPEDITION
11/06 12:54 556613 MOBLEY, Mi 112639 114 UE10 13.379  2.50840 0.20788 $36.34
11/13 08:15 556613 MOBLEY, Ml 112801 11.4 UE10 14.263  2.46860 0.20788 $38.17
11/27 08:58 556613 MOBLEY, MI 112935 11.0 UE10 12,225  2.40740 0.20788 $31.98
11/28 08:48 556613 MOBLEY, Mi 113125 14.2 UE10 13.337  2.40830 0.20788 $34.89
Miles: 638  12.0 53.204 $141.38 LH
\9
Department: 46-FACILITIES MAINTENANCE UE10 53.204 $141.38
Department Totals - 53.204 $141.38
SITE LEGEND
SITE # SITE NAME ADDRESS CITY STATE
556613 Exxpress Mart #27 3911 Pure Atlantic Rd Groves X
City of Groves Page 46



COVINGTON, LA 70434

' Fuelman

PO BOX 1239

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account # 217874
FLEET # 228771
Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 13 of 18

Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 228771 — CITY OF GROVES; 11/1/2023 — 11/30/2023

Department: 55 - SOLIDWASTE DEPARTMENT

SubDepartment: No Sub-Department

FUEL NET TOTAL  EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE _ DRIVER ODOMETER MPG TYPE QTY PRICE TAXES AMT CODE**
Unit 44 - 2023 Autocar
11/01 11:14 556741 BULLOCKM 10431 2.8 UDSL* 34.812  3.44820 0.20788 $127.27
11/02 13:19 556741 BULLOCK M 10538 25 UDSL* 43.371  3.44840 0.20788 $158.57
11/07 07:54 927808 BULLOCKM 10565 1.1 UE10 25577 3.56810 0.20788 $96.58 3
11/08 10:53 556741 Matthew Mc 10676 24 uUDSL* 47.018  3.40810 0.20788 $170.01
11/09 12:32 556741 Matthew Mc 10780 28 uUDSL* 37.282  3.40780 0.20788 $134.81
11/13 08:54 556741 BULLOCKM 10799 1.1 ubDSL* 17.187  3.40780 0.20788 $62.15
11/14 10:25 556741 BULLOCKM 10879 23 uUDSL* 34.951  3.40850 0.20788 $126.39
11/16 07:56 556741 BULLOCKM 10974 2.0 UDSL* 48.462  3.40820 0.20788 $175.24
11/20 10:51 556741 BULLOCKM 11079 24 UDSL* 43.734  3.40810 0.20788 $158.14
11/21 08:14 927808 BULLOCK M 11117 1.9 UE10 19.938  3.40760 0.20788 $72.09 3
11/21 13:25 556741 BULLOCKM 11182 23 uDSL* 28.254  3.40840 0.20788 $102.17
11127 10:06 556741 BULLOCKM 11295 2.1 UDSL* 52.873  3.40820 0.20788 $191.19
11/28 11:08 927808 BULLOCKM 11391 43 UE10 22.478  3.36820 0.20788 $80.39 3
11/29 10:56 556741 BULLOCKM 1143 0.0 uDSL* 34.103  3.34840 0.20788 $121.27
Miles: 1059 23 490.040 $1776.27 6 6
UNIT 47 — 2021 FREIGHTLINER
11/01 11:02 556741 PATE, WAYN 39584 4.0 UDSL* 26.243  3.44780 0.20788 $95.94
11/08 09:32 556613 PATE, WAYN 39669 3.0 UDSL* 28.510  3.44830 0.20788 $104.23
11/09 12:23 556741 PATE, WAYN 39778 39 uDSL* 27.970  3.40830 0.20788 $101.14
11114 11:15 556741 PATE, WAYN 39869 37 uUDSL* 24.493  3.40830 0.20788 $88.57
1115 14:18 556613 Matthew Mc 39961 3.8 uDSL* 24.231  3.40800 0.20788 $87.61
11/20 11:09 556741 PATE, WAYN 40055 3.2 uUDSL* 29.290  3.40800 0.20788 $105.91
11/21 10:44 556741 PATE, WAYN 40133 34 UDSL* 22.964  3.40840 0.20788 $83.04
11/22 13:23 556741 PATE, WAYN 40239 3.9 UDSL* 27.316  3.40790 0.20788 $98.77
11/28 10:27 556741 Nick Potte 40335 35 uDSL* 27152  3.40790 0.20788 $98.18
11/29 11:49 556741 Nick Potte 40411 3.0 uDsSL* 25.286  3.34810 0.20788 $89.92 ~
Miles: 932 35 263.455 $953.31 6 b
Department: 55 - SOLIDWASTE DEPARTMENT UE10 67.993 $249.06
UDSL* 685.502 $2,480.52
Department Totals -  753.495 $2,729.58
SITE LEGEND
SITE # SITE NAME ADDRESS CITY STATE
556613 Exxpress Mart #27 3911 Pure Atlantic Rd Groves TX
556741 Exxpress Mart #26 5410 W Parkway St Groves X
927808 B&b Mini Mart #2 3301 Cleveland Ave Groves TX
City of Groves Page 47



: FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT
. Fuelman Account # 217874

— FLEET # 228771
SRRSO, T Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 14 of 18

Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 228771 — CITY OF GROVES; 11/1/2023 - 11/30/2023

Department: 63- WATER PLANT

SubDepartment: No Sub-Department

FUEL NET TOTAL  EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE DRIVER ODOMETER MPG TYPE QTY PRICE TAXES AMT CODE**
UNIT100 — 2015 F100
11/09 09:29 556613 THOMAS, RO 35508 13.9 UE10 17.477  2.46720 0.20788 $46.77
11/21 09:40 556613 MOLBERT D 1999 0.0 UE10 15.616  2.40840 0.20788 $40.85 11
Miles: 243 13.9 33.093 $87.62 lL?)
Department: 63- WATER PLANT UE10 33.093 $87.62 -
Department Totals - 33.093 $87.62
SITE LEGEND
SITE # SITE NAME ADDRESS CITY STATE
556613 Exxpress Mart #27 3911 Pure Atlantic Rd Groves ™

City of Groves Page 48



™ Fuelman

PO BOX 1239
COVINGTON, LA 70434

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account #

FLEET #

Name:

MATCHING STATEMENT #

Page:

Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 228771 — CITY OF GROVES; 11/1/2023 — 11/30/2023

217874

228771

CITY OF GROVES
NP65577178
15 0of 18

Department: 64 - WASTEWATER PLANT

SubDepartment: No Sub-Department

FUEL NET TOTAL  EXCEPT
DATE _ TIME SITE _ DRIVER ODOMETER _MPG __TYPE Qry PRICE _ TAXES AMT CODE**
101 - 2019 Ford F150
11/09 12:49 927808 FOSTER, DO 25161 143  UE10 15.850 2.60880  0.20788 $44.64
11/28 12:46 927808 FOSTER, DO 25385 126 UE10 17.719  2.46800  0.20788 $47.42
Miles: 450 135 33.569 $92.06 LDU(
Department: 64 - WASTEWATER PLANT UE10  33.569 $92.06
Department Totals - 33.569 $92.06
SITE LEGEND
SITE#  SITE NAME ADDRESS cITY STATE
927808 B&b Mini Mart #2 3301 Cleveland Ave Groves X
City of Groves Page 49



™ Fuelman

PO BOX 1239

COVINGTON, LA 70434

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account # 217874
FLEET # 228771
Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 16 of 18

Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 228771 — CITY OF GROVES; 11/1/2023 - 11/30/2023

Department: 67 - WATER DISTRIBUTION

SubDepartment: No Sub-Department

FUEL NET TOTAL  EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE DRIVER ODOMETER MPG TYPE QTY PRICE TAXES AMT CODE**
Komatsu 35 - 67
11/03 07:19 556613 Kolby Schu 48699 214 uDSL* 6.302  3.44810 0.20788 $23.04
11/07 13:22 556613 Adrian And 4875 0.0 uDSsL* 4256  3.45160 0.20788 $15.57
11/09 07:59 556613 Corey Burt 4882 1.5 uDSL* 4743  3.40920 0.20788 $17.15
11/14 08:31 556613 Anthony Gr 4890 1.6 uDSsL* 5.051  3.40920 0.20788 $18.27
11/22 07:25 556613 Kolby Schu 48968 0.0 UDSL* 6.093  3.40720 0.20788 $22.03 LO ,/-{
Miles: 150 8.2 26.445 $96.06
TB216 — takKEUCHI
11/03 08:53 556613 Cory Sande 463 0.3 uDSL* 3514 345190 0.20788 $12.85
11/13 07:38 556613 Brandt Whi 472 2.2 UDSL* 4.041  3.40760 0.20788 $14.61
11/22 13:58 556613 SAWYER GRE 480 2.0 uDSsL* 3.995  3.40930 0.20788 $14.45 X
Miles: 18 15 11.550 $41.91 Lﬂ
Unit57 — 2009 F150
11/03 11:59 556613 SAWYER GRE 69949 7.8 UE10 23.573  2.50880 0.20788 $64.03
11/09 09:04 556613 SAWYER GRE 70162 9.5 UE10 22479 246810 0.20788 $60.16
1115 07:29 556613 SAWYER GRE 70351 9.0 UE10 21.005  2.40850 0.20788 $54.95
11/27 07:27 556613 SAWYER GRE 70577 9.0 UE10 25.053 240850  0.20788 $65.55
11/30 07:48 556613 SAWYER GRE 70742 10.2 UE10 16.191 2.36860 0.20788 $41.71
Miles: o78 9.1 108.301 $286.40 )\,p )
Department: 67 - WATER DISTRIBUTION UE10 108.301 $286.40
UDSL* 37.995 $137.97
Department Totals -  146.296 $424.37
SITE LEGEND
SITE # SITE NAME ADDRESS CITY STATE
556613 Exxpress Mart #27 3911 Pure Atlantic Rd Groves TX
City of Groves Page 50



™ Fuelman

PO BOX 1239
COVINGTON, LA 70434

FLEET MANAGEMENT REPORT

Account # 217874
FLEET # 228771
Name: CITY OF GROVES
MATCHING STATEMENT # NP65577178
Page: 17 of 18

Transaction Detail for Customer NO. 228771 — CITY OF GROVES; 11/1/2023 — 11/30/2023

Department: Garage

SubDepartment: 42

FUEL NET TOTAL  EXCEPT
DATE TIME SITE  DRIVER ODOMETER MPG TYPE QTY PRICE TAXES AMT CODE**
93 - 04 FORD F350
11/21 12:11 556613 Mark Berge 75314 8.1 UE10 29.650 2.40810 0.20788 $77.57 ‘
Miles: 241 84 29,650 srsr A
FORD16 - 05 FORD F150
11/02 11:36 556741 Adam Allre 159933 10.7 UE10 8.375  2.50750 0.20788 $22.75
11/07 10:46 556741 Adam Allre 160034 11.56 UE10 8.787  2.50710 0.20788 $23.86
11/09 08:12 556741 Adam Allre 160144 10.9 UE10 10.068  2.46920 0.20788 $26.95
1113 13:47 556741 Adam Allre 160298 10.8 UE10 14199  2.40790 0.20788 $37.14
11/15 13:09 556741 Adam Allre 160411 10.8 UE10 10.443  2.40830 0.20788 $27.32
11/27 10:40 556741 Adam Allre 160503 8.9 UE10 10.335  2.40740 0.20788 $27.03
11/30 10:50 556741 Adam Allre 160626 9.9 UE10 12.362  2.36860 0.20788 $31.85
Miles: 783 105 74.569 s19690 L] Ly
SubDepartment: 42 UE10  104.219 $274.47
SubDept Totals -  104.219 $274.47
Department: Garage UE10 104.219 $274.47
Department Totals -  104.219 $274.47
SITE LEGEND
SITE # SITE NAME ADDRESS CITY STATE
556613 Exxpress Mart #27 3911 Pure Atlantic Rd Groves TX
556741 Exxpress Mart #26 5410 W Parkway St Groves >
OTHER CHARGES
12/04/2023 Tax Exempt Filing Fee $148.27
12/04/2023 Extended Network Pricing $30.00
12/04/2023 Fraud Protector Fee $360.00
12/04/2023 Accelerator Rewards Elite $540.00
12/04/2023 Regular Package Fee $539.10
12/04/2023 Monthly Billing Cycle Fee $270.00
Total Other Charges $1,887.37
City of Groves Page 51



Site Updates

New Sites
Name Address City State Description Fuel Diesel Maint. ';i‘:“a‘: 23"::15

Circle K #8931-smart Desq 2624 S 1st St Tucumcari NM Circle K Y Y Y Y
Maverik Store #5398 10950 E Mississippi Ave Aurora CO Maverik Y Y Y Y
Maverik Store #5399 1875 S Havan St Aurora CO Maverik Y Y Y Y
Maverik Store #5402 4685 W 4000 S West Haven UT Maverik Y Y Y Y
Maverik Store #698 1647 S Dixie Dr Saint George UT  Maverik Y Y Y Y
Maverik Store #730 4109 E Main St Farmington NM  Maverik Y Y Y Y
Maverik Store #737 3289 S Fork Bld Idaho Falls ID  Maverik Yi Y Y Y
Maverik Store #738 111 Garner Lake Rd Gillette WY  Maverik Y b ¢ Y Y
Ta Glenrio C-store #471 1583 Frontage Rd 4132 Glenrio NM TA Y Y Y Y
Ta Glenrio Otr #471 1583 Frontage Rd 4132 Glenrio NM TA Y Y Y Y

City of Groves Page 52



P U R C H A § B O R D E R

City of Groves

PURCHASE ORDER # 09-36231 12/07/2023

ISSUED TO: VEND #: 01-10060 SHIP TO:
JEFFERSON COUNTY APPRAISAL DISTRICT City of Groves City Hall
APPRAISAL DISTRICT 3947 Lincoln Avenue
PO BOX 21337 Groves, TX 77619
BEAUMONT, TX 77720 Purchasing Department
UNITS DESCRIPTION G/L ACCOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
0.00 JCAD 1Q PYMT 01l ~5~05-~06~060 SINGLE APPRAISAL PAYMENT 0.00 18,042.12
JCAD 1Q PYMT

RECEIVED

DE£ “1 %ﬁB

FINANCE

**% TOTAL *** 18,042.12

ORDERED BY: LAMAR CQCZLEY

APPROVED BY: LAMAR OZLEY

City of Groves Page 53



JEFFERSON CENTRAL APPRAISAL DISTRICT
P.O. BOX 21337
BEAUMONT, TEXAS 77720-1337
(409) 840-9944
(409) 727-4611

BILL TO:

Mr. Lance Billeaud, Interim City Manager
City of Groves

3947 Lincoln Avenue

Groves, Texas 77619

] ”\ A ‘ A r}

DATE INVOICE #
12/01/23 1% Qtr Pmt.

DESCRIPTION

AMOUNT

First quarter payment on 2024 entity allocations is due on or before
December 31, 2023.

RECEIVED
DEC 0/ 273
FINANCE

$18,042.12

TOTAL

$18,042.12 V’(,/

!05\%

9100

City of Groves

N
\&

Page 54



PURCHASE ORDER

PURCHASE ORDER # 09-36114

ISSUED TO: VEND #: 01-

KONTROL AUTOMATION, INC
P.O. BOX 483

PRIMOS, PA 19018

City of Groves

11/20/2023

23643 SHIP TO:
City of Groves City Hall
3947 Lincoln Avenue
Groves, TX 77619
Purchasing Department

UNITS DESCRIPTION G/L ACCOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

1.00 START UP PARNEL 11 -5-64-03-110 WASTEWATER PLANT 6,200.00 6,200.00

START UP OF CENTRIFUGE PANEL #1.
INSTALL OF SLUDGE PUMP VFD.

ORDERED BY: COBY DOUCET

APPROVED BY: TROY W. FOXWORTH

City of Groves

*xx TOTAL *** 6,200.00

Page 55



PURCHASING REQUISITION /QUOTES

City of Groves, Dept. of Public Works

DATE: November 20, 2023 P.0. NUMBER: | 09-36114
TO: Kevin Carruth FROM: Coby Doucet

Purchase Recommendation

Recommended Company: Kontrol Automations, Inc(31989)

Items to be Purchased: Centrifuge Control Box Start Up and Install of sludge pump vfd.

CHARGE ACCOUNT ITEM DESC. QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST

11-5-64-03-110 Centrifuge Control Box Start Up and Install of 1 $6.200.00 $6.200.00

sludge pump vfd.
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

* Note: Purchases greater than 35000.00 Require Council approval before ordering! $6,200.00

REASONS FOR PURCHASE:

PART OF CENTRIFUGE CONTROL PANEL THAT WAS PURCHASED FROM KAI IT WAS

INVOICED SEPERATE OF THE CONTROL PANEL. THIS IS THE ONSITE PROGRAMMING

AND FUNCTION CHECK OF THE PANEL CONTROLER. INSTALL F SLUDGE PUMP VFD /
S5y u,\{o was ?ﬁ’\/ @ /\S\J Counc:\ C,\”yw.( Skaf bwy was (Nve. e

g_/ S¢ foga Y-

QUOTES s
COMPANY NAME NOV ALY COST
1. ICE $
2. FIN X $
3. $
4. $
5. $
P Date:
Approved by: 2 7«% e orp=
(PW Director) — - 4
Approved by: Date:
(City Manager)
Date Council Approved

C:\Users\Coby\Desktop\Purchasing Request\Kontrol Automations Inc. CA.doc

City of Groves Page 56



Kontrol Automation inc r
PO BOX 483 I\Al
Primos, PA 19018 US KONTROL

res@kontrolauto.com AUTOMATION
INCORPORATED

INVOICE
11/15/2023 68254
City of Groves WWTP City of Groves WWTP 11/20/2023
P.O. Box 848 1222 Taft Ave. EXT Net 30
Groves Tx, 77619 Port Arthur TX, TX 77642
05;36114
DATE ACTIMITY DESCRIPTION ary RATE AMOUNT
11/15/2023 Service Start up PM38000 control panel 1 6,200.00 6,200.00
4 6,200.00
0.00
6,200.00
$6,200.00

RECEIVED

NOV 23 2023
FINANCE

City of Groves SR Page 57



PURCHASING REQUISITION /QUOTES

City of Groves, Dept. of Public Works

DATE:  April 24, 2023 P.0. NUMBER: | 09-34634 |
TO: Lance Billeaud FROM: Coby Doucet

[Purchase Recommendation

|

! Recommended Company: Kontrol Automations, Inc(30837) -

Ttems to be Purchased: Centrifuge Control Box

QTY UNITCOST | TOTAL cos*r4\

CHARGE ACCOUNT | ITEM DESC.

11-5-64-09-010 \ NEW CONTROL PANEL FORCENTRIFUGE. | 1 | $57,500.00 | $57,500.00
Includes startup. |
11-5-4-09-010 | Freight s = 1 $2.000.00 | $2,000.00 |
N $0.00 |
}_ O J $0.00 |
o Y $0.00
F o $0.00
il $0.00 |
l P! $0.00
lr - $0.00 |
"__ * Note: Purchases greater than $5000.00 Require Council approval before ordering! $59,500.00 '
\ . |

|

REASONS FOR PURCHASE:
NEW CONTROL PANEL FOR CENTRIFUGE. ‘

Parts no longer available for existing contro] panel along with outdated software. KAI IS THE ORGINAL

BUILDER OF THE CONTROL PANELS FROM 1997.

QUOTES
COMPANY NAME COST
1. | Alfa Laval $ 83,070.77
5. | Huchison Hayes (Bought by Alfa Laval) Previous builder of box from 2019 $
3. $
4, 8
5. p
Approved by: l ﬁ{:/ g ’—‘/4 /‘f“:/ _,-}' Date: Z ,{ / _/
(PW Director) L P
Approved by: --éﬁ?/ﬁ@ %L/{()&.@W Date:
(City Manager)
Date Council Approved
C:\Users\Coby\Desktop\Purchasing Request\Purchasing Requistion or QuotesCA-council approvel.ios
City of Groves

Page 58



A ——

DA

Jtomation Inc

3

A+ 19018 US
atrolauto.com
INVOICE
Sh - 08/28/2023 N 68205
City of Groves WWTP City of Groves WWTP - " Old Dominion : 08/28/2023
P.0. Box 846 1222 Taft Ave. EXT b T 78028452916 -_ Net 30
Groves Tx, 77619 Port Arthur TX, TX 77642 ’
00-34634 _
DATE ACTIVITY DESCRIPTION QTyY RATE AMOUNT
08/28/2023 PM38000 Control Panel Centrifuge control panel 1  51,100.00 51,100.00
08/28/2023 Service Start up PM38000 control panel 0 6,400.00 0.00
51,100.00
0.00
h 1,474.55
52,574.55
$52,574.55
City of Groves

Page 59



P U R C H A S E 0O R D E R

City of Growves

PURCHASE ORDER # 09-36224 12 /0742023
ISSUED TO: VEND #: 01-22346 SHIP TO:
SOUTEX SURVEYORS, INC. City of Groves City Hall
3737 DOCTORS DRIVE 3947 Lincoln Avenue
Groves, TX 77619
PORT ARTHUR, TX 77642 Purchasing Department
UNITS DESCRIPTION G/L ACCOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
1.00 Preliminary planning 11 -5-67-09-604 2021 GLO CLFRF GRANT 13,500.00 13,500.00
0.50 Surveying 50% comple 11 -5-67-09-604 2021 GLO CLFRF GRANT 8,000.00 4,000.00
Payment request #1 for Engineering services at the
Watsewater Treatment Plant. Contract was
presented, discussed and approved at the 8-28-2023
regular coucil meeting. Contract will use CLFRF
grant funds.
*%% MOTRL; H4% 17,500.00

ORDERED BY: TROY W. FOXWORTH

APPROVED BY: TROY W. FOXWORTH

City of Groves Page 60



PURCHASING DOCUMENT FOR QUOTES ONLY

City of Groves, Dept. of Public Works and Engineering

DATE: December 12,2023 P.O. NUMBER: ’ 09-36224
TO: Kevin Carruth FROM: Troy W. Foxworth

Purchase Recommendation

Recommended Company: Soutex Surveyor& Engineers
Items to be Purchased: Engineering Pay Request No.1
ITEM DESC. QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST
Preliminary planning 100% complete 1 $13,500.00 $13,500.00
Surveying: Field Work $8,000 50% complete 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
* Note: Purchases greater than $5000.00 Require Council approval before ordering! $1 7,500.00*

REASONS FOR PURCHASE:

No. 1 payment request for Engineering services at Wastewater treatment plant . Service include
preliminary planning and surveying for the installation of new screening system and grit classifier at the
headworks. This contrct was presented to council and approved at the coucnil meeting on 8-28-2023.

QUOTES
COMPANY NAME COST
1 $
2. $
3. $
4 $
5 $
CHARGE NUMBER:  11-5-67-09-604  VENDOR NUMBER: 22346

Requested by: Troy Foxworth

s -
Approved by: e 7

(PW Director) < //
Approved by:

(City Manager)
Date Council Approved

City of Groves

Date: December 12, 2023
Date: /A /2- 17 3
Date:

Page 61




SURVEYORS&ENGINEERS

TBPE Firm No. F-5755
TBPLS Firm No. 10123800
LA EF.0005711

3737 Doctors Drive

Port Arthur, Texas 77642
Office (409) 983.2004
Fax (409) 983.2005

Invoice

BiLL TO City of Groves

3947 Lincoln Avenue
Groves, Texas 77619
City Manager / Accounts Payable

ITEM

ENGINEER

ENGINEER

DESCRIPTION

DATE 11/10/2023
INVOICE # 51422

Project No. 23-0445

CITY OF GROVES WWTP Improvements 2023
Installation of New Mechanical Bar Screen & Grit Classifier

Total Contract Amount: $ 128,000.00

I. PRELIMINARY PLANNING:
100% COMPLETED to date

& SURVEYING: II. FIELDWORK
Total: $8,000.00
50% COMPLETED to date

We appreciate your business.

Please call again.

City of Groves

AMOUNT
13,500.00
4,000.00
RECE;
NOv 16 203
Total  $17.500.00
Payments/Credits $0.00

Balance Due$17,500.00

Page 62




PURCHASING DOCUMENT FOR QUOTES ONLY

City of Groves, Dept. of Public Works and Engineering

DATE: December 7,2023

TO: Lance Billeaud Kevin (arfiukh

P.0. NUMBER: | 09-36221
FROM: David Molbert

Purchase Recommendation

Recommended Company: Texas Commission on Enviromental Quality

Items to be Purchased: Water System Fee
ITEM DESC. QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST
Water System Feee 1 $17,485.65 $17,485.65
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
* Note: Purchases greater than $5000.00 Require Council approval before ordering! $17,485.65*

REASONS FOR PURCHASE:

Annual Water System Fee to operate Water Plant

QUOTES
COMPANY NAME COST
1. $
2. $
3. $
4. $
5. $
CHARGE NUMBER: 11-5-63-06-180 VENDOR NUMBER: 400288
Requested by: (QW/ W Date:
Approved by: T Date: /D2 -7 2005
(PW Director) f"’f:”) 7 w Ve 4
Approved by: DEC 07 Date:
(City Manager) 3
Date Council Approved FIN ANCE
C:\Users\GRYV WTP\Desktop\Council Approval.doc
City of Groves

Page 63



PURCHASING REQUISITION /QUOTES

City of Groves, Dept. of Public Works

DATE: December 12, 2023 P.O. NUMBER: [09-36214

TO: Troy Foxworth FROM: Michael Tentrup

Purchase Recommendation

Texas Pride Utilities

Items to be Purchased: Wastewater Main Pipebursting

CHARGE ACCOUNT ITEM DESC. QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST
| 186700604 F}nal Pay_Apphcatlon (2022-2023 CLFRF $216,878.95
Pipebursting)
* Note: Purchases greater than $5000.00 Require Council approval before ordering! | $21 6,87895
REASONS FOR PURCHASE:
Final Pay Application for 2022-2023 CLFRF Pipebursting project
QUOTES
COMPANY NAME COST

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.
Requested by: Michael Tentrup Date: December 12, 2023
Approved by: Q ¢7¢ P Date: /Z ~ / 7 "Zf}‘ﬁ

(PW Director) /,..'-" 4 / »
Approved by: Date: /. /3/&?
(City Manager) 7 L:// roa
Date Council Approved
Page 64

City of Groves




P U R C H A § E O R D E R

City of Groves

PURCHASE ORDER # 09-36214 12/06/2023
ISSUED TO: VEND #: 01-23392 SHIP TO:
TEXAS PRIDE UTILITIES LLC City of Groves Public Works
725 CARBY RD 4925 McKinley Street
Groves, TX 77619

HOUSTON, TX 77037 Purchasing Department

UNITS DESCRIPTION G/L ACCOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

0.00 FINAL PAYMENT 11 -5-67-039-604 2021 GLO CLFRF GRANT 0.00 216,878.95

FINAL PAYMENT AND RELEASE OF RETAINAGE. CITY
COUNCIL APPROVED AS COMPLETE ON 12/4/23

*xx TOTAL *** 216,878.95

ORDERED BY: MICHAEL TENTRUP

APPROVED BY: TROY W. FOXWORTH

City of Groves Page 65



3 7{0 %3%7, 1

04-
Contractor's Application for Payment
Owner: CITY OF GROVES Owner's Project No.:
Engineer: SOUTEX Engineer's Project No.: 21-1000
Contractor: TEXAS PRIDE UTILITIES, LLC Contractor's Project No.:
Project: 2022 SANITARY SEWER PIPE BURSTING PROJECT
Contract:
Application No.: 10 Application Date: 11/10/2023
Application Period:  From 9/1/2023 to 10/24/2023
1. Original Contract Price S 1,970,291.50
2. Net change by Change Orders S (181,819.50)
3. Current Contract Price (Line 1 + Line 2) S 1,788,472.00
4. Total Work completed and materials stored to date
(Sum of Column G Lump Sum Total and Column J Unit Price Total) S 1,788,472.00
5. Retainage
a 0% X S 1,788,472.00 Work Completed = S -
b. X $ - Stored Materials = $ .
c. Total Retainage (Line 5.a + Line 5.h) S -
6. Amount eligible to date (Line 4 - Line 5.c) S 1,788,472.00
7. Less previous payments (Line 6 from prior application) S 1,571,593.05
8. Amount due this application (s 216,878.95
9. Balance to finish, including retainage (Line 3 - Line 4 + Line 5.c) S -

Contractor's Certification

The undersigned Contractor certifies, to the best of its knowledge, the following:

(1) All previous progress payments received from Owner on account of Work done under the Contract have been
applied on account to discharge Contractor's legitimate obligations incurred in connection with the Work covered by
prior Applications for Payment;

(2) Title to all Work, materials and equipment incorporated in said Work, or otherwise listed in or covered by this
Application for Payment, will pass to Owner at time of payment free and clear of all liens, security interests, and
encumbrances (except such as are covered by a bond acceptable to Owner indemnifying Owner against any such
liens, security interest, or encumbrances); and

(3) All the Work covered by this Application for Payment is in accordance with the Contract Documents and is not

defective.
Contractor: /cocas Foicde (43tidies [L O
Signature: citos ;s Ya Date:  ./io/zs

Recommended by Engineer Approved by Ow
/By:/ 4 ] By:

Title: i Title:

LQgt\e:J J i fy/23 Date: lz/ca,/zs

Approved by Funding Agency

By: By:
Title: Title:
Date: Date:

EJCDC C-620 Contractor's Application for Payment
(c) 2018 National Society of Professional Engineers for EICDC. All rights reserved.

City of Groves Page 66




S0 T ‘paniesal sYBi |y "DQD3 104 sieauidul [Buoissajol4 JO A1a100S [euoneN 8107 (2) 8dld Nun
juswAeq Joj uonedjddy 540124300 0Z9-D DA

(00°000°ZT) %0ST 00°000°9€ 00°000°9E 009 00°000°'vT $ | 00°000°9 H v3 v yidep Y 6-G ‘sse|81aql4 ‘Ma (|EISU| JO ‘B|oyuey 2de|day pue 3AOWaY ST

= %00T 00°009°TT 00°009°TT 007 00°009'TT $ | 0o'008’s S v3 z yidap 3 § ueyy ssa| ‘sse|3iaqld ‘MaN |jeisu| Jo ‘Sjoyueiy ade(day pue anoway(  pTD
00000y %0 & 5 - 00'000'y S| o008 $ AS 0S $)93.15 g sAemanliq 83a40u0) 9|  E1D
00'00S'E %0 : S = 00'00S'€ $ [ o00L $ AS 0s (9llemapis) 83a.0u0) p| 2T
00°000'87 %0 g & “ 0000082 $ | oooL $ AS 00y (Aempeoy) jjeydsy ,»|  T1D
00'000°C %0 5 = = 00'000'7 $ | 00002 S v3 0T syidaq pue sazis ||e ‘uoljeAeax3 Aq jerowsay uonanisqo| 01D

& %00T 00°00Z‘T 00'002'T 00'T 00°00Z'T $ | 00'00z'T S v3 T jnouea|) aui jo pul 62

= %00T 00°09€'2S 00°09€ZS 00°'LL 00°09€'7S $ | 00’089 $ v3 LL sy3daQ pue sazis ||V SUORIAUUDD JIIAIAS J02UU0IY 8
(05°£2L'Y) %8LY 0S'LL6'S 05'LL6'S 00'T6€'C 00°0S2'T $|osz S Ell 005 siaump Aq pa3dallq se Bul-AL pue 3ujuea)d sUoiRINLISU0I-3s0d /=)

E %00T 000978 00'09%'8 00'VBE'E 00098 s|osz $ 4 YBEE 8ul-AL pue ulues|d> sUORINIISUOI-3ld 9
(00°00%) %C0T 00'02£9Z 00'02L°92 00'899 00'0Z€°9Z $ | ooor S Fil 859 3ddH ,OT Y3Im Buiising 'Jamas 0T 23e [a)
(00°955%) %L0T 00'ZTE'0L 00'ZTE0L 00'890°C 0095459 $ | oove $ 41 vEET 3daH ,8 YIM Ising "1amas g aje: =]

= %00T 00°'876'9 0082697 00764 0082697 $ | oove $ 41 6L 3d0H .8 YIM 1s1ng ‘Uemas 9 ae; ]

= %00T 00'000°ST 00°000°ST 00T 00°000°ST $ | oo'o00’sT $ S1 T (P19 3seq jo %G pasaxa 03 Jou) uohiezl|igoN 12

= - 2 - S uojdujysep

- %00T 00'000°C 00'000°C 00T 00°000°7 $ [ 00000z $ s1 T jouo)ayjelt| €14

{00°000°81) %00Y 00°000'%2 00°000'¥C 00’ 000009 $ | 000009 S v3 T y3dap 36-5 UBY) S537 ‘sse|Biaqld ‘MaN |[e3su] Jo ‘Bjouely adejday pue anoway| T4
00'00V"LT %ST 00'008'S 00'008'S 00T 00°00Z°€7 $ | 00008°s $ v3 v Ydap 34 § ueyy ssa7 ‘sse|31aqiy ‘MaN ||easul 10 ‘3joyue|y 3oe|day pue 3nowyY| 118
00°000°S %0 2 = 00°000°S $ | o000t $ AS 0§ s392.15 g sAemanuq 3jai0u0) 9  0T8
00'00S'y %0 - & 00'00S'? $ | 0006 $ AS 05 (s)|emapis) sja10u0) ,p| 68
00'000'C %0 i = 00°000°C $ | o0'002 [ v3 01 syidaqQ pue s32iS || ‘uoljeARIX3 AQ |BAOWISY UORINNISAO 88

g %00T 00°00t'C 00°00v'Z 00T 00°00%'C $ | 0000Z'T $ v3 z 1nouea|) aury 4o pu3 L8

00°0v2'ZT %L9 00'09T°SZ 00°09T°SZ 00°LE 00°00t°LE $ | 00089 S v3 SS syydaQ pue sazS ||y SUOIIBULOD 3IIAISS JI9UU0IDY 98
(00'00°7) %10S 00'v05C 00'70ST 00'70S'Z 00°00S $| oot $ 41 005 s13umo Aq pa3dauig se 3ul-AL pue Fuiues|d suolaNIIsU0-3s0d S8

E %00T 00'092°9 00'092°9 00'70S'7 00'092°9 slosz $ 41 05T BUI-AL pue SUIUES[D SUORONIISUOD-B1d [Z]

< %00T 00'99€'6T 00'99€'6T 00°TZY 00'99€°6T $ | o09r S Ell j334 3daH ,ZT Yum Buising ‘1amas ,z1 3ielljiqeysy 3]
(00"7€) %00T 00°958°0L 00'958°0L 00'%80C 002Z8°0L S| 00vE S Ell £807 3daH .8 YUM 3sing ‘1amas 8 3jelljiqeyay zd

2 %00T 0070008 00'0008 00'T 00'0008 $ | 00'000°8 $ S1 T (P19 aseq JO %S Paadx® 0} J0u) Uonez|IqoN 149

& = ~ - S uelug ewadng

= %001 00000 00°000°C 00T 00°000° $ | 000002 $ s1 T Jouo) aiyjed| STV

2 %00T 00°000°S 00'000°S 00'T 00°000°S $ | 00'000°s S S1 T S33.] pUe ‘sqnuys ‘sjue|d |ejusweusQ adejday|  pIV

00°000°€ %E9 00'000°S 00'000'S 00°SZT 00°000°8 $ | coay S Ell 007 $33eD pue ‘saouaj USpooM uljuley) ade|day pue sroway €IV

s %00T 00'0SZ 00'057 00°052 00'0SZ s|oot $ 41 0SZ uopdaold Yuall| 7TV
{00°000°0€) %9ET 00°000¢TT 00°000'yTT 00'6T 00°000°78 $ | 00'000'9 $ v3 vT yadap 3 6-G UBY) 5527 ‘sse|31aq14 'M3N ||eisu| 0 ‘3|oyuey 3de|day pue srowRyd[  TTV

00'00%"LT %SL 00°002°ZS 00°00Z'ZS 00'6 0000969 $ | 00°008°s $ v3 [43 Yadap 3 § uey) ssa7 ‘ssej3uaqid ‘MaN ||eIsu| 1o ‘3joyuely ade|day pue saoway| 0TV
00'009°ZT %0T 00'00¢'T 00°00p'T 00°0Z 0000077 $ [ 000z $ AS 007 (Aempeoy) yjeydsy ,p[ 6V

- %00T 00'000'C 000007 00'0T 00'000C $ | 00°00Z S v3 [} syidag pue sazis ||e ‘uoijeArdX3 Aq [BAOUISY UOIINASO| 8V

3 %00T 00°002°T 00'00Z'T 00T 00°00Z'T $ | 00002t S v3 T Jnoueay aurjopui| Ly
(00°089) %00T 00'09.0vT 00°09£°0¥T 00°£0C 00°080°0¥T $ | 00089 $ v3 90T syydaQ pue sazis ||y SUCKIBUUOD 2IIAIDS }29UU0IRY 9v
(00'9et'Y) %S 00'9€%’S 00'9€Y’S 00'9€b'S 00°000'T $| o001 S 41 000'T s1aumQ Aq pajoaulq se Bul-AL pue FUjueajd sUOHINIISUOI-}sOd sy
(00°s€) %00T 08°£L0°0T 0S'££0°0C 00'T€0°8 0S'7v0°0T $|osz S 41 £10°8 8ul-AL pue BUlUE3|d SUOHINIISUOI-3ld (4]
(00'v14) %0071 00°0TH°0SZ 00°0T¥'0SZ 00'S9€E"L 0096967 $ | oo've S Fil YYE'L 3daH ,8 YAIM 3sing 1amas g aielljiqeyay £V

00°8€C %66 00'719°2C 00'7¥9'2T 00'999 0078872 $ | oove $ 41 €49 3daH .8 YUM3sing "Jamas ,9 33eiljiqeyay [47
= %00T 00'000'ST 00'000'SZ 00T 00°000°SZ $ [ 00°000°sZ S S1 T (piq 3seq Jo %G paadxa 03 J0U) UOIeZ|IGON v
N F . - $ ysy w3 ‘adey ‘A0
13e13u0) |eUINO
($) (%) ($) ($) ($) Hom 3y3 ($) ($) suun Ayuenp waj| uondisaq ON
(r- @370 (14 H) (9 u1 Jou) palois (9x3) uj pajesodioou) (3x2) 3214 un way| pig
uv ysiuy4 03 aduejeq waly 3jeq 03 paJols >=:0._.5U sjeulle|y | aleq 03 vﬂuu_nEOU Eu:ﬂ:d wiay| pig Jo anjep
0 anjep sjeualey pue IOM JO 3njepA pajewss3
0% | paswdwo)yiom
pa33|dwo) YoM UOHBWLIOM| JIBI3U0D)
1 A r | H | 9 d | E] | a | ) ] v
€2/01/11 :23eQ uonedyddy £€2/v2/01 o £€2/10/60 woid :poag uopedyddy o1 o uopedddy
penuo)
19310¥d ONILSYNE IdId ¥IM3IS AYVLINYS 2207 pafoid
"ON 123(0.d 5,4033e13U0) O71 ‘S3LNILN 3014d SYX3L :10198U0)!
0001-T2 'ON P2foad s 133utBu3 X3LN0S :193u1duy
"ON P3f04d 5, J3UMO S3IAOYD 40 ALID aumQ

juawded Joj uonednddy s, 032e43U0)

3I0M 33114 Juqn - ewls] ssaidold

Page 67

City of Groves



sz "PanIasal sysu |y "DAD(F 4o} s19auidug [euolssajold 4o A1a1o0s (euoieN 8TOZ (9) 2014 Hun
jJuswAeq Joj uonedijddy §,4032843U0) 0Z9-D DAJI3
00'000'Y %0 g 3 - 00'000'% $ | 00'00v $ v3 [ syidaq pue sazs [je ‘uoneAedxd Aq eroway uolonnsqol 64
00°000C %0 g = 2 00°000'C $ | 000007 $ v3 T jnoues|) aul Jo pu3 84
00'0vY‘S %98 00089V 00'089 V€ 00'1S 000210 $ | 00089 S v3 65 syidaq pue sazig ||y SUOHIBUU0) 1SS 109UU0IRY £
(00°T¥8) %89T 00'TPE'T 00'TPE'T 00'THE'T 00°00§ $|oot S 41 00S $I3UMQ Aq pa1dauiq se ui-AL pue Bujues|d suoj3antisuod-3sod 94
(00°512) %EOT 00°ST6'L 00'ST6'L 00'99T°€ 00°00L°L slosz S 4 080€ Bul-AL pue 3ulueald sUoIINIISUOI-3ld Sd
= %00T 00'89L'8T 00°89L'8T 00°'T6€E 00'894'8T $ | oo'sy $ 41 T6€ 3dQH 7T Y3IMm Bunsing 1amas ,ZT 1e3)iqeyay [Z]
(00°'9€€) %10T 00°085'TY 00085 T 00066 00TV $ | oozy $ 41 786 3dQH ,0T YuMm Bunsing ‘J18mas 0T 23e3ljiqeysy €4
(00'259°7) %S0T 00'069°09 00'069°09 00'S8L'T 00°'8€0°8S $ | 00'vE $ ELl LOLT 3daH .8 YIM 3sing ‘1amas g aielljigeysy <]
S %00T 00°000°0T 00°000°0T 00'T 00°000°0T $ [ 00'000°0T S Sl T (Piq 3584 JO %S Pa3IX3 0} J0U) UOLRZI|IGOW T4
. = 3 = $ uos|im
2 %0017 000007 00°000°C 00'T 000002 $ | 000002 $ Sl T lonuo)dyjeds| T3
= %00T 00°00T 00001 00007 00°00T $[oot 3 41 00T uonaajod youall[  p13
= %001 00°000°T 00'000'T 00T 00000°T $ | 00'000'T $ vi T 3/9joyuey owsql €13
00°000'9 %SL 00'000'8T 00°000'8T 00'E 00°000'%7 $ | 00°0009 $ v3 v yydap 3 6-G ueyy ssaq ‘sse|diaqly ‘MaN ||e3su| 1o ‘3joyuei soe|day pue aAoway [A%]
(00°008'S) %ETT 00°002°ZS 00°00Z°ZS 00'6 00°00v°9% $ | 00°008°S S v3 8 yidap 3 g uey ss37 'sse|diaqld ‘MaN ||e3sul Jo ‘3joyuey ade(day pue snowRy| 113
00°00S‘Y %0 3 = - 00005V $ | 0006 $ AS 0S 5323.35 7§ SABMBAI( 31315U0D 9 013
00°005'C %0 = = - 00'00S'Z $ | 0008 $ AS 0s (sAemapis) @180u0) . p| 63
00°095'T€ %L1 00'0bY'y 00'0pb’y 00'LE 00°'000'9€ $ | 000zt $ AS 00€ (Rempeoy) yeydsy .p| 83
00°00Z°'T %0p 00°008 00008 00t 000002 $ | 00’00z 3 v3 01 syidaq pue sazis [|e ‘uoljeAedx3 Aq [eAoway UoRINIISGO ]
00°00Z'T %0 - Z - 00°00Z'T $ | 000027 $ v3 T anouesyaurjopui] o3
00°008'9 %8 00'089'VE 00°089'VE 00'TS 00'080'TY $ [ 00'089 S v3a 19 sydaq pue sazis || SUOI}IBUUOD 3IIAIRS JDauU0Y| &3
00°005°C %0 5 = 000052 s|osz $ Ell 000T 543UMQ Aq pajdaulg se Bul-AL Buiues|d suolINIISU0I-150d 3
00'052 %L6 00'0Z€'8 00'0ZE'8 00°'8ZE'E 000458 s|osz $ Fll 8ZVE 3ul-A\L pue 3U1UBa|d SUORINIISUOI-Bid €3
00°00b'€ %L6 00'ZST'ETT 00°ZST'ETT 00'8Z€’E 00°Z85°9TT $ | 00'vE S ElLl 8TYE 3daH .8 Yim ising ‘Jamas g8 jelljiqeyay 3
& %00T 00'000'€T 00°000'€ET 00T 00°000'€T s|{oo000€T  § s T (Piq 358q 4O %S Paadxa 0} Jou) Uohez|IGoN 13
- = H - $ (puejaaa|) 03 £2) |121131
3 %00T 00°000'C 00°000'Z 00'T 00'000'7 $ | 000007 $ s 1 Josuo)dyyeil|  91d
Y %00T 00'0ST 00'0ST 00°0ST 00°0ST $| oot $ 41 0ST uoiasjold uall|  s1a
= %00T 00'000'T 00°000'T 001 00°000°T $ | 000007 3 v3 1 ajeuiwl|a/sjoyuey owag|  ¥1d
00'0089 %0 - 2 £ 00°008'9 $ | 000089 $ v3 T Yidap 3 6 uey) 3o ‘sse[31aqld ‘MaN |[eisu) Jo ‘sjoyueln ade(day pue arowsy|  €Id
3 %00T 00°000°0€ 00°'000°0€ 00'S 00°000°0€ $ | 000009 S v3 S yidap 3 6- ‘sse|8iaqld ‘MaN |[R3su] JO ‘ajoyuely ade[day pue aroway|  ZIq
& %00T 00'008°S 00'008'S 00'T 00'008'S $ | 00°008's $ v3 T yidap 3 § ‘sse|31aq14 ‘MaN |jeIsul 40 ‘djoyue|y aoe|day pue aroway[  TTQ
00000 %0 = = E 00'000'% $ | 0008 $ AS 0S s123.15 1@ sAemanuq a3aouo) 9| 0Td
00'005C %0 = = - 00'005 2 $ | oo'os $ AS 0S (s)]emapis) a1210u0) . p| 60
00°096'0€ %1 00°070°'S 00°0¥0°'S 007t 00'000°9€ $ | oo'0zt $ AS 00€ (Aempeoy) 3eydsy .v| 80
00°000°C %0 < - B 000007 $ | 00’00z $ v3 o1 syidaq pue sazis ||e ‘UojieAedx3 Aq jeroway uondnisqo|  /d
= %007 0000Z°T 00'00Z°T 00T 00°00Z°T $ | 00002t $ v3 T Inouea() aul 4o pu3z 9a
= %00T 00°089'V€ 00°089°VE 00'TS 00'089°VE $ | oo089 $ v3 15 syjdaq pue saz(s ||y Suoi}23ULED 3DIAIBS JoauUoRY|  Sa
(00°€£9) %SET 00°€L1'T 00'€L1'T 00'€ELT'T 00°'00$ $|oot $ il 005 s19UMQ Aq pa3oaulq se 3ul-AL pue uiues)d suodndisuod-isod|  va
(00°s£7) %S0T 00'0LT°9 000419 00'891'C 00°S68°S $|osz S Fil 8SE€T 3ui-AL pue Bulueajy suogonsjsuod-ald|  €a
(00'0vL'E) %S0T 00°ZI6'E8 00'716'€8 00°89%7 00'7L1°08 $ | 00'vE $ 41 8SET 3dQH .8 YIM 151ng "Jamas 8 alelljiqeysy zd
7 %00T 0000001 00°000°0T 007 00'000°0T $|oo000'0T S s1 1 (P1q 3seq JO %G P32dXa 0} Jou) Uofe: 1d
N < < = $ (yeL 03 puejaA3)) |1P43L
= %00T 000007 00'000'2 00T 00°000'2 $ | 000002 $ s1 T loiuo)dyeds| 61D
5 %00T 00°00€ 00°00€ 00°00€ 00°00€ s| oot $ 41 00€ uopaajold Yaualll  81d
00°009°ET %09 00°00¥'02 00°00%°0C 00'€ 00°000'7€ $ | 00'008'9 $ v3 S yydap 3 6 ‘sse|diaqid ‘maN ||eIsu| Jo ‘djoyuely ade|day pue arowad| 91D
(s) (%) ($) ($) 5] oM 343 $) $) suun Aypuenp way uondudsaqg ON
(r- 1/ (1+H) (9 ut 30u) paiois (9%x3) uj pajesodiodu] (3x2) 0 Wun way pig
n: ysiui4 03 aduejeg w3y 3jeQ 031 pa40is 2«:9::0 sjeuale | leq 03 vﬂ«u_nEou E:m:d w3y pig jo anjep
4o 3njep sjeullje pue IO JO 3njeA pajewnsy
0% | paeidwo)iom
pa19jdwo) 3om uopew.oju| eHJUO)
1 P r 1 H | B) 4 [ 3 [ [ | 2 ] v
€Z/0T/TT  :@1eq uopedyjddy €z/vz/ot o T ez/tofe0 | woug :popad uopeajddy ot oN uopeyjddy.
penuo)
103(0¥d DNILSYNE Idid HIM3IS AUVLINYS 2202 p3foid
"ON 13044 5,4019B3U0D OT1 ‘S3ILINILN 3A1Yd SYXIL :10penuo)
0001-17 *ON 13[04d s, 493ui8u3 X3LNos :43auidu3
"ON P3[01d s J3UMQ SIAOYD 40 ALD 43umo

judwAed o) uonedddy s,1019e43u0)

MO 231id Jun - Aewns3 ssasdold

Page 68

City of Groves



§jo € ‘pantasal s1y3u ||y "DAD(3 404 siesuldug [Ruoissaj0ld Jo AjRId0s |eucheN 8T0Z (2) adud wun
juswAed 10} uonedlddy sJ03oeluo) 029-d 2Ad3
05'6T8'T8T $ |%16 00ZLp'88LT  $| - $ | oozev'ssL't $ 0S'T62°0L6°T  $ [sie301 39enu0) [euiduo
= %00T 00°000'Z 00°000°Z 00T 00°000°C $ | 000007 $ S1 T losuo) diyedl) LT
3 %007 00°052 00°0SZ 00°05Z 00052 $|oot $ 41 0SZ uoIjoid Youall[ 914
00'008°€T %L9 00009°LT 00'009°LZ 00t 00°00t'TY $ | 00'006'9 $ v3 9 Yidap Y 6 Ueyy atow ‘sse(d1ad|4 ‘MaN ([B3su] JO ‘djoyuely 3de|day pue arowsy ST4
S %001 00°000'ZT 0000071 00'Z 00°000'ZT $ | 00°000'9 $ LE] Z Yidap 3 6-G ‘sse|1a814 ‘MaN |[e3su| JO ‘Bjoyuein dae|day pue arowdy| T4
= %00T 00°00v°LT 00°00%°LT 00'E 00°00¢'LT $ [ 00'008°s S v3 £ Yadap Y § uey) ssa7 ‘sse|diadiy ‘maN |[e3sul 10 ‘Sjoyue|N 3ae(day pue aroway €14
= %007 00'000°S 00°000°S 000§ 00'000°S $ | 00001 3 AS [ 5123115 1§ sAemanuiq 333.0u0) 9| ZTd
= %007 000057 000052 0005 00005 $ | oo0s S AS 0§ (sy]lemapis) 3a00u0) v TT4
00°0S0°LT %19 0005697 00'056'9Z 00'SYZ 00000t $ | ooott $ AS 00% (Aempeoy) eydsy p|  0Td
($) (%) ($) $) ($) HoMm 3y ($) ($) suun Ayguenp way uondsaq ON
(r- (a/n (1+H) (9 ut 30u) pasos (9x3) uy pajesodiodu) (3x2) adud wun way pig
) ysiuid 03 duejeg| w3y a1eq 03 pasols  |Ajuaun) sjeale | aeq o3 parajduio) Amuenp wa)| pig 40 3NjeA
jo 3nfep sjeualey pue MO/ JO 3njep pajewnsy
0% pajajdwio) yJoMm
pa1a|dwo) 310M UOLBLLIOJU| }IR13U0D
1 k] r 1 H | B F] | 3 | a E) ] v
€z/ot/11 :31eq uopedddy €z/vz/ot 2} €2/10/60 woiy ipouad uonedyjddy ot "ON uoped)jddy
Peszuo)
103rOYd ONILSYNE 3did YIMIS AUVLINYS 2207 pafoid
"ON P23[0.d 5,4039843U0) O71 'SILILA 3A1¥d SYXIL 10penuo)
0001-TC 1"ON 13f0.d §,433ui8uz X3LNOS BEENEDE]
"ON 12fo1d s Jaumo SIAOYD 40 ALD J3umo
judwied 10} uonedjddy s,1010e3u0) IO/ 221d Nun - 33w s] ssaidold

Page 69

City of Groves



G0t ‘pantasal syaul ||y "DAD(T Joj s192u18u3 |euoissa)0.d Jo Aya1d0S [euoneN 8T0Z () @oud Jun
juawAeq 104 uoneaiiddy s, Jojoeiuo) 0z9- QA
(00°002°1) (00'9) (00°002°T) $ [ 00007 $ v3 ot syydaq pue sazis ||e ‘Uol3eARIXT Aq [BAOWIRY UORANISGO /3
(00'002°T) (00'T) (00°002°7) $ [ 0000z'1 S v3 T Inouea)d aun Jo pu3 93
(00'008°9) (00°0T) (00°008°9) $ [ 00089 $ v3 19 syydaq pue sazis ||y SUOHIBULOD 3DIAISS 103UU0IBY ]
(00°0057) {00°000°T) (00005 2) s$losz $ 41 0001 $33uMQ Aq pa3daJ1Q se Bul-AL BuIUE3)I SUORINIISUOI-}SOd v3
(00°052) (00°001) (00°052) s]osz $ 41 8TVE Bui-AL pue Bulues|d SUOIIONIISUOI-BUd €3
(00°00%€) (00°00T) (00°00%€) 00'vE $ 41 8TVE 3daH ,8 Yim isung ‘J1amas g 3lelljiqeyay [£]
2 = = (pueana|) 03 £2) 113431
(00'008°9) (00'1) (00°008°9) 00°008°9 $ v3 T Yadap 3 6 ueY) aI0 ‘sse(dsaqid ‘MaN ([eIsu| 1o ‘sjoyuey ade(day pue arowdy|  E1d
(00°000°Y) (00°05) (00°000) $ | oo'08 S AS 05 5199.15 13 sAemaAliQ #32.5u0) 9| 01d
(00'0052) (00'05) (00°005°2) $ | oo'0s $ AS 0S (s4jemapis) 33a10u0) p|  6d
{00°096'0€) (00'852) (00°096°0€) $ | oo'0zt $ AS 00€ (Aempeoy) 3jeydsy | 8d
(00°000°Z) (00'07) (00°0002) $ | 0000z $ v3 [ syidaq pue sazis ||e ‘uoijeaedx3 Aq [enoway uodnisqo|  £d
00°€L9 00°'€L9 00°EL9 $| oot $ 41 00S s19umQ Aq pa3oalld se 3ul-AL pue Buluea)d suodnlisuod-isod|  va
00°SLT 00071 00°SLT $|osz $ 41 8SET 3ul-AL pue Buluea]d suononiisuod-aid|  €a
00°0pLE 00017 000VL'E $ ] 00PE $ 41 8SET 3d0H .8 YIIM 1sng ‘Jamas 8 a1eyljigeyay za
N - - $ (yeL 03 pueaA3])) [13413L
(00°009°€T) (00°2) (00°009°€T) $ | 00"008’9 $ v3 S yidap Y 6 'ssejBiaqyy ‘MaN |jeisu| 10 ‘djoyueln doejday puB arowsy| 91D
00°000'ZT 007 00°000ZT $ | 000009 S v3 v ydep Y 6-G ‘ssejd1aqld ‘MaN |[eisu] 10 “sjoyuely ade(day pue anoway|  STD
(00°000%) (00°05) (00°000%) $ | o008 S AS 05 s12a.3S g shemanllq 31840u0) ,9] €10
(00'005°€) (00°08) (00°005°€) $ | 000z $ AS 0S (sY]emapis) @jausu0) .y 21D
(00'000'8Z) (00°00t) (00'000'82) $ | 000z $ AS 00Y (Aempeoy) eydsy »|  TID
(00'0007) (00'0T) (00°0007) $ | 0000z $ v3 o1 sydaq pue sazs ||e ‘UolieAedx3 Aq [eAowsy UolANSO| 01D
0§ L2LY 00'T68'T 0S'LTL'Y $|osz $ 41 005 S12UMQ Aq pa3oadlq se 3ul-AL pue Bujuead SUORINJISU0I-3s0d £
00°00¥ 00°01 00'00Y $ | oooy $ 41 859 3daH 0T Y3m Bunsing ‘Jamss 0T aeyjiqeyay| 0
00985y 00'vET 009557 $ | 00've S il vE6T 3dQH .8 YIIM Ising ‘Jamag ,8 33e|iqeydy €
- - - $ uojdujysem
00°000°81T 00'€ 00'000°8T $ | 00’0009 $ v3 T y1dap 1e-§ uey) ssa ‘sse|diaqi4 ‘MaN |[eisu| Jo ‘Bjoyuely adejday pue sroway [4%:]
(00°00v'LT) (00°€) (00°00t°LT) $ | 00'008's $ v3 [ yadep 3 g ueyy ssa] ‘sse|31aq14 ‘MaN |)BIsU] 40 ‘3|oyuely 3dB|daY puk BAOWRY|  TTd
(00°000°S) (00°05) (00°000°5) $ | 0000t S AS 0S 5192435 g sAemanlIQ 338ou0) 9| 0T8
(00°00Sv) (00°0S) (00°005'p) $ | 0006 $ AS 0s (SAjemapis) a1313u0) ¢ 68
(00°000°2) (00°01) (00°000Z) $ | 00'00Z $ v3 0T syjdaq pue sazs ||e ‘uoleAedxX3 Aq [eAoway uolINISqO 84
{00'0vz'ZT) (00'81) (00'0v2'21) $ [ 00089 $ v3 SS syidag pue sazis ||y SUo}IaUU0) 3IAIBS PaUU0IRY| 94
00'700C 00'700'C 00'v00°T $|oot S il 005 s19umQ Aq pa3oauiq se Sui-AL pue Bujues)d suopdniisuod-isod| g
00'7€ 00T 00'7E $ | oove $ 41 €807 3dQH 48 Yum 3sing ‘Jamas g ajeljiqeyay|  za
= - 5 uelug ejuadng
(00°000°€) (00's2) (00°000°€) $ [ 000t $ il 00Z 3120 pue 's3aua4 UapooMm Hjuljuley) adejday pue snowRy| €TV
00°000°0€ 00'S 00'000°0E $ ] 00°000'g $ \E] P Yidap 3 6-§ Uey) ssa7 ‘ssejdiaqid ‘MaN |[eIsu) JO ‘s|oyueiy adejday pue srowsy|  TTV
(00°00%'LT) (00°€) (00°00%'LT) $ | 00'008’s $ v3 [43 Yadap 3 § uey ssa7 ‘ssej21aqld ‘MaN ||e3su| JO ‘ajoyue|y de|day pue anowy|  OTV
(00°009'2T) (00'081) (00°009°2T) $ | oooL S AS 002 (Aempeoy) Jeydsy ,p| 6V
00089 00'T 00°089 $ | 00089 $ va 907 sy3daQ pue sazis ||y SUORIBUUOD 3IIAIRS J93UL0Y| 9V
00'9Er'y 00°9EY"Yy 00'9EY'Yy sloot $ 41 000'T SI3UMO Aq P31oaltQ se 3ui-AL pue BUlues|d SUORINIISU03-}s0d SY
00'SE 00T 00°SE $|osz $ 41 L10'8 3ul-A| pue 3ujueajd suUoINIISUOI-ald v
00'7TL 0012 00'vTL $ | oove S 41 pYE'L 3dQH ,8 YIM 35ing 1amas , g dleyljiqeysy £V
(00'8€7) (00'2) (00'8€7) s | oo've S Fil €49 3d0H .8 YiIM 1sing Jamas 9 Ael|iqeyay|  zv
- ysv w(3 ‘3de ‘yeo
siapiQ 23uey)
($) (%) $) ($) ($) oM ayd ($) %) syun Auend wayy uondudsag ‘ON
(r- @rsn (1+H) (9 uj J0u) paiois (®x3) uj pajesodiodu] @x2) 14 Jun w3y pig
4) ysiuig 03 duejeg| wayy 2leq 01 pa1o3s  |Apuaun) ?jeq 03 pajajdwo) 1} anjep
Jo anjep sjeualey pue HOM JO 3njeA pajewns3 Pesjuo) uj 3duey)
0% | paie|dwo)yiom
pa1ajdwo) yiom uopneulIoju| 2e3U0D)
il A r 1 H | 9 E] | 3 i a | E) ] v
€C/0T/TT  :31eq uogeayddy €2/v2/01 o T ez/tofeo | woay pouaq uonealjddy ot oN uogedyddy
penuo)
153r0¥d ONILSYNE 3did HIM3IS AMVLINYS ZZ0Z Pafoid
_||| oN 12(01d 5,4019e13u0) 371 SIILILA 3a19d SYXIL sJopenue)
0001-TC +"ON P3foud s, J3auiBuz X3aLNOS :193u8u3y
ON 193(01d 5, 43UMQ SIAOYD 40 ALD 13umo

awhed i0) uonedn|ddy s oldei3uo)

IO 39144 JuUf - dewiys] ssaidold

Page 70

City of Groves



Sjo g ‘pansasal sy ||y "DADrd Jo) sieauldug [euolssajold Jo Aleinos euoijeN 8T0Z (9) 231d Uun
juawAeq 10} uoneaijddy s,1010B13U0D 0Z9-D JAII
- $ [woot  [oozzv'sert  $[ - $[oozev'sect § [o0zev'8sc’t — § [siesoLpaloid
$13pJQ 3duey) pue pesuo) [euisug
(0S'6T8‘T8T) $ [%0 g $ - $ - $ (0S'6T8T8T) ¢ [sie301 1api0 28ueyy
(00°008€T) (007) (00°008€T) $ [ 000069 S vi 9 y3dap 3 6 Ueyy 210w ‘ssej8ia3l] ‘MaN |[eISU] JO ‘Sjoyuey 3ae|day pue anoway ST4
(00'050°21) (00°s5T) (00°050°LT) $| ooott $ AS [ (Aempeoy) jjeydsy | 0T4
(00°000°t) {0o'0T) (00°000°7) $ | o000y S v3 0T syidag pue sazis ||e ‘uoieArdxX3 Aq jeAcWwaY UORINASIO 64
(00°0007) (00°T) (00°000°2) $ | 000002 S v3 T 1nouea|) aur Jo pu3 84
(00°0v1'S) (00'8) (00"0pp's) $ | 00'089 $ v3 65 syidag pue sazis ||y SUOHIBUUOD BIIAIIS J93UU0IBY Z]
00°'T¥8 00198 00'TY8 $[oot $ 41 005 513UMQ Aq pajoauld se 3ul-AL pue 3uiuea)d suoi3INIISU0I-3s0d 94
00§12 0098 00'STZ $losz $ 1 080€ 3ul-AL pue 3ujues)d suUoRONIISU0I-3id S4
00'9€EE 008 00'9€€ $ | oozy $ 41 786 3dQH ,0T Yum 3unsing J1amas 01 e €4
00'759°C 00°8L 007897 s | oove $ 41 LOLT 3daH .8 YIM sing ‘Jamas 9 33e; [2]
= = E $ uosiim
(00°000°9) (00°T) (00°000°9) $ | 00°000°9 $ v3 2 yydap 3 6-G uey) ssa7 ‘sse3iaqd ‘MaN ||eIsu| Jo ‘sjoyuely ade|day pue sroway| 213
00'008'S 00'T 00°008°S $ | 00'008°s $ v3 8 yidap 3 § ueyy ssa1 ‘sse|31aq1J “MaN |[eisul Jo ‘B[oyue|N ade|day pue aAowdy|  TT3
(00005 V) (00°0S) (00°00S) $ | o006 5 AS 05 5322115 g sAemanliq 83840u0) 9 013
(00'005°7) (00°0S) (00°005'2) $ | 0005 $ AS 0S (Afemaplig) 832.0u0) . p| 63
(00°095'T€) (00°€97) (00°095'T€) $ | 00’0zt $ AS 00€ (Aempeoy) Jeydsy ,p| €3
$) (%) $) ($) (6] Hom 3y (8) (%) syun Ajnuenp way uondusag "ON
(r- @/n (1+H) (9 u130u) paio3s (9x3) uj pajesodiodu] @xa) aud wun wayj pi1g
d) ysiulg 03 dueeg| Wy ajeg o3 pasols  |Apuaun)y 2e@ 01 p o} Apuenp anjep
Jo anjep sjeuajep pue }IOAMN JO 3N pajewnsy Penuo) u| uu:m__u
0% | parajdwodpom
Pa12]dwo) yom UOJ3BWIO}U]| 3IRA3U0)
1 b r 1 H | 9 4 | E] | a [ 2 q v
€2/01/11 :93eq uonedddy €z/ve/ot ] £2/10/60 woiy :pouad uonedyjddy ot *oN uonedl|ddy
penuo)
153r0¥d ONILSHNE 3dId ¥IM3IS AYVLINYS 2207 p3foid
"ON 23014 5,403083U0) J71 ‘S3ILITILN 3A1¥d SYXIL openuo)
0001-1Z "ON 193[044 5,433u18u3 X3LNOS :133ui8u3
ON 13(01d S J3umQ S3IAOY¥9 40 ALID BECT)
udwAed 10} uonedddy s,Jo1de11u0) IO 2211d U - ewiys] ssaiSold

Page 71

City of Groves



00°09€'2S $ %00°00T 172 $ 0 0009£7s$  |00LL 00°089$ v3 syidaq pue s3zS ||V SUOI}IBUUOD 3IIAIS JO3UU0IBY L
05°LL6'S $ %0Z'8LY 1667 $ T6€T 00052'TS  |oo00s 0s7$ 41| sieuMQ Aq paysauig se Bul-AL pue Bulues)|d SUOIINIISU0D-1SOd 5
00°09%'8 $ %00°00T ¥8EE S 0 00°05%'8$ 00'v8EE 0sZ$ 11 Bul-AL pue 3ujuea|d SUOIINIISUODI-Did g
00'07L'9Z S %CSTOT 899 S 0 00°0ZE'9Z$  |00°8S9 00°0v$ Bl 3dQH ,0T Yam 1sing J1amas 0T e 4
00°TTE0L $ %E6°90T 890T $ 0 00'952'59$  |00'¥E6T 00'7ES 41 3daH .8 Yim 3sing ‘1amas g aje: € m
00°826°92 3 %00°00T 6L $ 0 00'876'92$  |00°Z6L 00'VES 41 JdAH ,8 YIIM 1sing “1amas 9 aiellligeyay z (O]
00°000°ST S %00°00T T $ 0 00°000'ST$ 00T 00000sT$ | $1 uoneziiqoiN T w
QYVYAITINOY NOLONIHSYM -D dlg 0.
0070007 $ %00°00T T $ T 000007$ |00 00°000Z$ s1 |043u0) diyel] €T
yidaqg ye6-S ueys
sog00:ve # xocioo 4 8 9 oooegss 00 UU00093 LE ssa7 ‘sse|3iaql4 ‘Map |eisu| Jo ‘djoyuely adejday pue sAowY 1
yidaq yg ueyy
00008’ 3 woosz r ¥ v ov00z'ezs  fooy 0708SS vi 5597 ‘sse|3iaq14 ‘MaN |BIsu| Jo ‘Sjoyuely a3ejday pue sAoway 11
= $ %00°0 0 S 0 00°000°s$  |00°0S 00°00T$ AS 393135 g sAeMaALIQ 93a10u0) 9 ot
- S %00°0 0 $ 0 00'005'v$  |00'0S 00°06$ AS (sA[emapis) 312.12U0) 6
- $ %00°0 0 $ 0 000007$  [00°0T 00°00Z$ v3 syida@ pue sazis ||e ‘UolIeARIX] AQ [BAOWY UOIIINISGO 8
00°00%'7 S %00°00T T $ 0 00'00v'Z$ |00 00°00ZT$ V3 inoues|) aur o pug L
00°09T'SZ $ %LT L9 LE S 0 00°00¥'LES  |00'SS 00°089% V3 syydaqg pue sazI§ ||y SUCI}IBUUO) DIAISS 102UU0IRY 9
007057 $ %08'00S ¥0SZ $ 0SZ 00'00s$  |00°00s 00°T$ 41|  sisumo Aq pa1dauip se Bul-AL pue Bulueajd sUolIINIISUOI Js0d S
0009'9 $ %00 00T $0sZ $ 0 000929 [00°pOSZ 0s2$ Ehl Bul-AL pue Buiuea|d suoloniIsuod-ald s
00'925°C $ %00°00T 1y $ 1y 00'9z5'2s  |ooTzy 00'9$ 1 (3uawisnlpy) 3daH ,ZT YHM Ising “19mas ,ZT aieyjiqeyay vE
00°0Y8'9T $ %00°00T L2474 $ 0 00°0v8°9TS  [00°TZ¥ 00°0v$ 41 3dQH ,ZT Yam 1sing ‘Jamas 7T a3eijiqeyay €
00'958°0L S %S0°00T 802 $ 0 00'728'0LS  |00'€80T 00'vES £l 3dAH ,8 YUM 1sing ‘Jamas g alelliqeysy Z
00°000'8 $ %00°00T T $ 0 000008 |00T 00°0008% Sl uoneziiqoN 1
INNIAV NVAYE 2 3NV VINION3 -8 A8
00°000°C $ %00°00T T $ 0 000007 00T 00°000Z$ s1 [osuo) digel) ST
00°000°S $ %00°00T T $ 0 00000°'s$  |00T 00'0005$ $1 $9a1] pue ‘sqnuys ‘sjue|d [eusweuso dejday b1
00°000°S $ %0579 setT $ 0 000008 |00°00Z 00°0%$ Ell 53189 pue ‘s3JU4 USPOOM Huijuiey) 3oejday pue aroway €1
00°0ST $ %00°00T 0sz $ 0 00°05Z$ 00052 00T$ Ell u0I3193301d Youai] P4
Yidaq Y 6-5 ueyy
00°000%TT $ %TLSET 6T $ € 00000985 {00°bT 00°0009% v3 5557 ‘sse[Biadis ‘maN [[easul Jo ‘S[oyUEl 938|doy pUE SAOWSH i
YidaQ 3 § ueyy
00'002'ES $ xoost 6 $ g Gonogiesy  Jogzt 00008y LE 5537 ‘ssejB1aqi4 ‘Map ||eIsu] Jo ‘djoyueiy aaejday pue anowy [1)4
00°00v°T $ %00°0T 0z $ 0 00000vT$  [00002 00°0L$ AS (Aempeoy) yeydsy v 6
0010007 $ %00°00T ot $ 0 000007 |ooot 000028 Vi syidaq pue sazis ||e ‘UopeARIXF Aq [RAOWIRY UOIIINISGQ 8
00'00Z‘T $ %00°00T T S 0 0000Z'T$  f00T 00°00ZT$ v3 inouea|) aul jo puj L
00°092°0¥T $ %6¥°00T 20T S 0 00°080°0¥T$  [00°90T 00°089% v3 syjdag pue sazs ||y SUOI3IUUO) IIIAIIS JI3UU0IY 9
00'9€Y°S $ %09°EVS 9EYS $ 9EYS 00'000'T$  [00°000T 00'1$ Fil Bul-AL pue Buluea|d SUOI}INIISUOI-3SOd 5
0§'£L0°0T $ %L1 00T 1£08 S 0 0STv0'0Z$  |00'LTO8 05Z$ 41 8ui-A | pue Bujuea|d suoi3INIISUOd-3ld v
00°0T¥'0ST $ %62 00T S9EL S 0 00'969'6¥2$ |00 ¥VEL 00'VES 31 3d0H ,8 Yim 1sing ‘1amas 8 3lelljiqeyay €
00'vY9°2Z S %96'86 999 $ 0 00788'7Z$  |00°€L9 00'vES 41 3daH ,8 YIM 1sing 1smas 9 ajelljiqeysy z
00°000°SZ $ %00°00T 1 $ [ 00000°57$  |00'T oo'000sz$ | S1 T
INNIAV HSY 3 'INNIAV W13 INNIAV I 1dVN INNIAV ¥V0 -V aig
SW3lraig asva 2]
AINNOWY 10d aldy ALLNVND 3JLVALLSI ALLLNVND QiF 30Rdd ALILNVYND 30Rid  LINN NOILdIRIOS3A W3l w
3Lva-oL 31va-ol 31va-olL aoiad aviol aig LINN Avd m
JONVINNOL4NId 1D93roxd LOVHINOD TVNIDRIO G
©
Sdiaa SveL sanoio jo Ko ..WJ
868£°€£5°187 yaloid Bunsing adid Jemas Aejiues zzoz Q
> LE0LL X1 uoysnoH 0001-12 19eloid
P Aqred gzL TY9.LL X1 Unypuy yod
£202/52/0L ‘2jeQ 3910AU| 2771 ‘senunn apud sexay woury anuQ s10)00Q LELE
€ZOZ/LE/OL-ETOT/L/6 MIYL PRIRIdWOD YoM susauibuz g siokamnung xanog
oL TON 9jewns3 ERI] sanol9 jo Ajo H N




00°000'0T

000007
00°00T
00°000°T

00°000°3T

00°00T'TS

000"y
00008

00'089'pE

00°0ZE'8
00°ZSTETT
00000'ET

00°000'C
00'051
00°000'T

00°000°08

00°008'S

00°0%0°s
00°002'T
00'089'V€
00'ELTT
00°0£1°9
00°Z16'€8
60°000°0T

000007
00°00€

007000

006009

00°009'TT

000027

Y T SRV SR S S Y

“w

L R A

«

Wwon o o n

%00°00T

%00°00T

%00°00T

%00°00T

%00°SL

%0S7TT

%000

%000

REETT

%00°0Y

%000

%19ES

%000

%80°L6

%680LE
%00°00T

%00°001

%00°00T

%00°00T

%000

%00°00T

%00°001

%000

%000

%00'¥T

%000

%#00°00T

%00°00T

%09 YEL

%9940T
%99 ¥0T
%00°00T

%00°00T
%00°00T

%0009

%00°051

%00°00T

%000

%000

%00°0

%000
%00"00T

1s

8LEE
8IEE

18

£L7T

89T
89T

" 0 o o ©

00001

00°008'S

00°08T

Q0'ELT'T

00°00€

»ow o o w

R A R Y IR

s

L R A LR

001

o o o © o o

ost

o © o o o o

€11

00€

o o o o o

00°000°0TS

000007
00°001S
00'000°T$

00000V

00'00Y'9Y$
00°005%S
00°0057$
00°000'9€%
00°000°7$
00'002'1$
0008y TVS
00°005'T$
00704583
00°285°9TTS
00°000°€T$

00'000°7$
00°0ST$
00'000'T$

00°008'9%
00°000°0£%
00°008'SS
00°000'v$
00°00ST$
00°000°9£%
007000°2$
00°00Z°1$
00'089'VES
00°00S$

00'568'5$
00°ZLT08%
00°000'0T$

00'0002$
00°00£$

00'000'FES

00'000%Z$

00°009°TTS
00°000t%
00°005'€S
00°000°8Z$
00°000'7$
00'007'T$

00T

00°00T

00T

00y

008

00°05

00°0S

00°00E

00°0T

00T

0019

00°0001

00°8TYE

00°8ZPE
00T

00'F
00°0ST
00T

00T

00T
00°05
00°0S
00°00€
000t
00T
00'TS

00005

00°8SET
00°85€7
00T

00T
00°00€

008

00T
00°05
00'05
00°00%
00°01
00’1

00°0000TS

00°0002$
00T$
000001

00°0009$

00°0085$

00°06$
00°05$
00°021$
600025
0000213
00°089%

0525

0578
00°pES
00°000ETS

00°0002$
00°T$
00°000T$

00°0089%

00°0009%

0000855

00085
00°058
00°02T$
000025
00°00ZT$
000895

00'TS

057$
00°vE$
00°0000T$

00°00025
00T$

00°0089%

0000095

00°0085%

00'08%
00023
00°04%
00°002%
0000218

EH
vi

vi

v3

AS
AS
AS
v3
vi
V3

41
41

1
41
Y3

v3

i

v3

AS
AS
AS
v3
va
V3

31
41

1

v3

v3

v3

AS
AS
AS
¥3
v3

uonezigow
INNIAY NOS M -3 aig
1043U0) Jj4Rl)
UO0I1981044 YOUdLY
23RUILINT/BIOYURI OWR]

yidaqg
4 6-5 ‘SSEI810qi4 ‘MaN fieIsu] 10 ‘Djoyuepy sdeiday pue sAcway

wdag y § uey
5537 ‘ssejBIaqid ‘Map JleIsul J0 ‘Djoyuepy aaeday pue saowiay

$198.435 1§ SARMIALI(Q 31342000 9
(sx1emapis) 81840u03 ¥
{Aempeoy) yeydsy v

syidaq pue sazIs jje ‘UoEABIXT AQ {BACWSY UONONISGO

1noueayy) aufy Jo pul
sYIdag pue $aziS ||y SUORIBUUOD) BJIAIAS JIBUUOIBY

SIBUMQ Ag PaldasiQ se Bul-Af pue Buiuea)d SUORINIISUO-1SO4

Bui-A| pue Bujueajd SUOIINIISUOI-Big

IdQH ,8 YIMISINg FIMIS 8 SlliqeyRY
uoeziqon

{0J3U0D Jijjeay
UOI933044 Yousi]
areulLYI/BloyuR oWwag
yideq y 6 ueyy
IO ‘ssejBiaqi] ‘MeN jjeIsu 10 ‘Rjoyueyy 2IRidaYy pue IAoWRY

ydaq
U 6- ‘ssejfiaqid ‘MaN |jeisul 10 ‘joyueln adejdoy pue aaowRY

yidaq Y 5 ueys
5537 ‘sseiB1aq14 ‘M3N JJRISU] 1O ‘Djoyuely dejday pue 30wy
5198135 1@ SABMBALI] 31240U03 5
(sAtemapis) 3ja10u0) v
(Aempeoy) jjeydsy &
Sy3da(] pue s3zs [je ‘uoneaeIx] AQ [BAQWITY UOIMNISAO
Inoues|) aur] jo pu3
syydag pue Sazs |jy SUOIBULOYD SDIAIBS JO3UU0IY

SIBUMQ Ag PaaaIIQ se Sul-A L pue Buluea)d sUoiINASU0I-1S04

Fup-AL pue SUIUES[D SUOHIONISUOT-Bid
3daH 8 Yam 15ing Jamas g aiedijiqeyay
uoneziiqon

INNIAY 1dVL 0L 3NNIAY ONVIIATT) } 133415 TII¥Y3L -a aig

{03U07) )R
UOIDBI0IG YouDl]
ydag y g ueys
2101 ‘ssejBiaqi4 ‘MaN ||eIsu] Jo ‘sjoyueiy adepday pue arowsy
yidag
U6~ ‘ssejBiagiy ‘manN Jleisul Jo ‘sjoyueiy sdeiday pue sAcwaY
yadag
Y G ‘ssejBiaqid ‘Man |jEIsul 10 ‘Bjoyueiy adejday pue aroudy
$3192415 9 SABMOALIQ 31240U03 G
(sajemapis) a110u0) ¥
(Aempeoy) jeydsy v
syydag pue sazis jje ‘UOKBARIXS Aq [BACWIZY UCIIINISGO
wnoues) aurt o pul

ST
21
€1

[4%

- N

97
st
i

€T

A

1T

YW N e O

oMo

LT
9T

st

141

€1
[
It
ot

Page 73

City of Groves




2 Rehabilitate 6" Sewer, Burst with 8" HDPE LF $34.00 1707.00) $58038.00 o s 1785 104.573% s 60,630.00
4 Rehabilitate 10" Sewer, Burst with 10" HDPE LF $42.00 g8200| $41,2¢2.00 0 $ 530 100.81%% ] 41,580.00
5 Rehabilitate 12" Sewer, Burst with 12" HOPE LF $48.00 39100 $18768.00 0 s 391 100.0035 s 18,768.00
6 Pre-constructions cleaning and TV-ing LF $2.50 3080.00| $7,700.00 ] $ 3166 102.79% S 7,915.00
7 Post-constructions cleaning and TV-ing as Directed by Owners  |LF $1.00 500.00] $500.00 1341 $ 1,341.00 1341 268.20% S 1,341.00
8 Reconnect Service Connections All Sizes and Depths EA $6£0.00 53.00| $40,120.00 ] S 51 85.44% $ 34,660.00
9 End of Line Cleanout EA | $2000.00, 100 $2,000.00 ] s 0 0.00% $ -

10 Obsruction Removal by Excavation, all Sizes and Depths EA $400.00 10.00] $4.000.00 o $ 0 0.00% $
11 4" Asphalt (Roadway) Sy $110.00 400.00]  544,000.00 0 S 245 61.25% $ 26,950.00
12 4" Concrete (Sidewalks) sy $50.00 5000 $2,500.00 50 s 2,500.00 50 100.00% $ 2,500,00
13 6" Concrete Driveways & Streets SY $100.00 so.00f  $5.000.00 0 s 50 100.00% $ 5,000.00
14 Remove and Repface ngﬂs_wwo.xnnﬂo_w”.m__ New, Fibergiass, Less A $5800.00 300 17,2000 o s 3 100:00% s 17,400.00
15 Remove and Replace gu:_..o__unn. MM: Install New, Fiberglass, 5-9 ft EA $5000.00 200] $12000.00 v s 3 06.00% s —
16 Remove and Replace Manhole, or install New, Fiberglass, More EA £6900.00 00| s41.40000 & s i e s 2760000

than 9 ft Depth
17 Trench Protection LF $1.00 25000  5$250.00 250 s 250.00 250 100.003% $ 250.00
18 Traffic Control s $2000.69 1.00] $2,000.00 0 $ 1 100.60% $ 2,000.00
TOTAL BASE BID ITEMS $1,970,291.50
OTALS $1,970,291.50 542,257.50 $1,788,472.00
Total Eamed this period $42,257.50
: Total Eamed to Date $1,788,472.00
RC\ Zs \ = 'y Less 10% g $178,847.20
" Texas v:.t%@..ﬁ Le Date Less Previous Payments $1,571,592.05
Amount Due This Period $38,031.75
Contract inag $178,847.20
Approved: Total A t Due This Appli $216,878.95
Soutex Surveyors & Engineers Date

Original Contract Amount $1,970,291.50
Contract Modifi $0.00
A Total Contract Amount $1,970,291.50
City of Groves Dale ge of C by Value 80.77%

Page 74

City of Groves



FICHC=

Change Order No. 1|
Date of Issuance: November 11, 2023 Effective Date: November 11, 2023
Owner: The City of Groves Owner's Contract No.:
Contractor: Texas Pride Utilities, LLC Contractor’s Project No.:
Engineer:  Soutex Surveyors and Engineers Engineer's Project No.:  21-1000
Project: 2022 Sanitary Sewer Pipe Bursting Project Contract Name:
The Contract is modified as follows upon execution of this Change Order:
Description: Change in price to reflect final “as-built” quantities.
Attachments: [List documents supporting change]
CHANGE IN CONTRACT PRICE CHANGE IN CONTRACT TIMES
[note changes in Milestones if applicable]
Original Contract Price: Original Contract Times:
Substantial Completion:
$.1.970.291.50 Ready for Final Payment:
days or dates
[Increase] [Decrease] from previously approved Change [Increase] [Decrease] from previously approved Change
Orders No. ___ toNo. __: Orders No. ___ toNo.___:
Substantial Completion:
S Ready for Final Payment:
days
Contract Price prior to this Change Order: Contract Times prior to this Change Order:
Substantial Completion:
$.1.970.291.50 Ready for Final Payment:
days or dates
[trerease] [Decrease] of this Change Order: [Increase] [Decrease] of this Change Order:
Substantial Completion:
$.181,819.50 Ready for Final Payment:
days or dates
Contract Price incorporating this Change Order: Contract Times with all approved Change Orders:
Substantial Completion:
$.1,788,472.00 Ready for Final Payment:
P days or dates

OMMENDED: ACCEPTED: /Acc%
By: By: By: /T

’\ / Engineer (lf required) Owner (Authorized Signature) C%actorﬁ\uthorized Signature)
\&‘T_igg‘/’ 2 T‘tle T'tle F’D;ﬂ:f ‘L 7C/uzat =
Date: 11)i3/23 Date Date L feo [22 =
71 AL
Approved by Funding Agency (if
applicable)
By: Date:
Title: ’
)
EJCDC’ C-941, Change Order.
A Prepared and published 2013 by the Engineers Joint Contract Documents Committee.
Page 1of 1

City of Groves Page 75






